IDAHO
ADMINISTRATIVE
BULLETIN

October 3, 2018 — Vol. 18-10

Idaho Department of Administration
All Rights Reserved
Printed in the United States of America

The Idaho Administrative Bulletin is published monthly by the Office of the
Administrative Rules Coordinator, Department of Administration, Statehouse Mail,
Boise, Idaho 83720-0306, pursuant to Title 67, Chapter 52, Idaho Code.

C.L. “Butch” Otter, Governor
Robert L. Geddes, Director, Department of Administration
Dennis Stevenson, Administrative Rules Coordinator
Bradley Hunt, Administrative Rules Specialist
Jason Shaw, Regulatory Analyst and Publishing Specialist

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 1 October 3, 2018 - Vol. 18-10



IDAHO ADMINISTRATIVE BULLETIN

Table of Contents
October 3, 2018 — Volume 18-10

PREFACE ...ttt 12

IDAPA 02 - DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE
02.04.14 — Rules Governing Dairy Byproduct
Docket No. 02-0414-1801
(Second) Notice of Intent to Promulgate Rules — Negotiated Rulemaking.............cccccovevverievenreenennnnne. 20

IDAPA 07 — DIVISION OF BUILDING SAFETY
07.02.06 — Rules Concerning Idaho State Plumbing Code
Docket No. 07-0206-1702
Notice of Rulemaking — Adoption of Pending Rule .............coccoiiiiiiiiiinieecee e, 21

07.03.01 — Rules of Building Safety
Docket No. 07-0301-1801
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE ...........ccoeiiiiiiiieiicceceseeeeee e e 22

07.05.01 — Rules of the Public Works Contractors License Board
Docket No. 07-0501-1801
Notice of Rulemaking — Adoption of Pending RUle ...........cccceiiriiiieiiinicee e 34
07.07.01 — Rules Governing Installation of Heating, Ventilation,
and Air Conditioning Systems, Division of Building Safety
Docket No. 07-0701-1703
Notice of Rulemaking — Adoption of Pending RUIe ...........ccccevieiiiiiiieiciccecceeeeee e 35

IDAPA 08 - STATE BOARD OF EDUCATION
08.01.04 — Residency
Docket No. 08-0104-1801
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RULE ...........cooiiiiiiiiiiiiie e 36

08.01.13 — Rules Governing the Opportunity Scholarship Program
Docket No. 08-0113-1802
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE .........c.ccuiiiiriiiiiiiiiicececeseeeeeee e es 39

08.02.02 — Rules Governing Uniformity
Docket No. 08-0202-1802

Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE ...........ccooiriiiiiiieiieeeeeeeee et 45
Docket No. 08-0202-1803

Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RULE ...........cooiiiiiiiieeie e e 52
Docket No. 08-0202-1804

Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RULE ..........c.ccoeiiiiiiiiieiiccceeteeeeeee et 69
Docket No. 08-0202-1805

Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE ...........cccooieiiiiiiieiiceeeeeeee et 71

08.02.03 — Rules Governing Thoroughness
Docket No. 08-0203-1803
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RULE ...........oooiiiiiiiieieeee e 87

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 2 October 3, 2018 - Vol. 18-10



IDAHO ADMINISTRATIVE BULLETIN

Table of Contents

Docket No. 08-0203-1804

Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed Rule .........cccccoevevieiiniciiieiens

08.05.01 — Rules Governing Seed and Plant Certification
Docket No. 08-0501-1801

Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed Rule...........ccccoeoeniiiininiincnnn.

IDAPA 10 - BOARD OF PROFESSIONAL ENGINEERS
AND PROFESSIONAL LAND SURVEYORS

10.01.01 — Rules of Procedure
Docket No. 10-0101-1801

Notice of Rulemaking — Adoption of Pending Rule ..........c...cccc..e.

10.01.02 — Rules of Professional Responsibility
Docket No. 10-0102-1801

Notice of Rulemaking — Adoption of Pending Rule ...........c.ccoceeen.

IDAPA 11 - IDAHO STATE POLICE: IDAHO BRAND BOARD
11.02.01 — Rules of the Idaho State Brand Board
Docket No. 11-0201-1801 (Fee Rule)

Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed Rule............ccccoeceniiiiniiinnen.

IDAPA 13 - IDAHO FISH AND GAME COMMISSION
13.01.07 — Rules Governing the Taking of Upland Game Animals
Docket No. 13-0107-18014P

Notice of Amended Proclamation ...............ccceeeeveveiveeiviveeeeieeeeeneeenns

13.01.08 — Rules Governing the Taking of Big Game Animals
in the State of Idaho

Docket No. 13-0108-1802

Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed Rule .........cccccoeveevieviininieniieiene,

Docket No. 13-0108-1803

Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed Rule .........cccccoevivieienieiinieiens

Docket No. 13-0108-1804

Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed Rule ..........ccccoooiviiiininiiiiis

Docket No. 13-0108-1805

Notice of Rulemaking — Temporary and Proposed Rule.....................

13.01.09 — Rules Governing the Taking of Game Birds
in the State of Idaho

Docket No. 13-0109-1804P

Notice Of Proclamation..........ccuuvviiiiivieiiiiiiieiee e

Docket No. 13-0109-1805

Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed Rule .........cccccvevvivieviininiiniiciin,

13.01.10 — Rules Governing the Importation, Possession, Release, Sale,
or Salvage of Wildlife

Docket No. 13-0110-1802

Notice of Rulemaking — Temporary and Proposed Rule.....................

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 3

October 3, 2018 - Vol. 18-10



IDAHO ADMINISTRATIVE BULLETIN Table of Contents

13.01.16 — The Trapping of Predatory and Unprotected Wildlife
and the Taking of Furbearing Animals

Docket No. 13-0116-1802
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE .........c.cccoeviiriiiieiiieeee e 145

13.01.17 — Rules Governing the Use of Bait and Trapping for Taking Big Game Animals
Docket No. 13-0117-1801
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUle ...........cccooiiiiiiiiiiiii e 148

IDAPA 16 - DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND WELFARE
16.02.01 — Rules of the Idaho Time Sensitive Emergency System Council
Docket No. 16-0201-1801
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE .........c.cccveiiriiiieiiiieeeeee e 151
16.02.02 — Rules of the Idaho Emergency Medical Services (EMS)
Physician Commission
Docket No. 16-0202-1801
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RULE .........c.cccieviiiiiiieiiiiciccceee e 155

16.03.03 — Rules Governing Child Support Services
Docket No. 16-0303-1801 (Fee Rule)
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE .........c.ccieviiriiiieiiieecee e 157

16.03.04 — Rules Governing the Food Stamp Program in Idaho
Docket No. 16-0304-1801
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIe ...........cccooiiiiiiiiiiiii e 159
16.03.08 — Rules Governing the Temporary Assistance for Families
in Idaho (TAFI) Program
Docket No. 16-0308-1801
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE .........c.cccieviiriiiiieiiieeeee e 169

16.03.09 — Medicaid Basic Plan Benefits
Docket No. 16-0309-1801

Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIe ...........cccooiiiiiiiiiiii e 175
Docket No. 16-0309-1804

Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RULE .........c.cciiviiriiiieiiciiiccceet e 185
Docket No. 16-0309-1805

Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE .........c.cccieiirieiieiiceeeee e 188
Docket No. 16-0309-1806

Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIe ...........cccoeiiiiiiiiiie e 191
Docket No. 16-0309-1807

Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE .........c.cccveviiiiiiiieiiiiicieee et 205
Docket No. 16-0309-1808

Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE .......c..ccccciriiiiiniiniiniiiiicieieeen ettt 207
Docket No. 16-0309-1810

Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIe ...........cccoeiiiiiiiiiiieeee e 219

16.03.10 — Medicaid Enhanced Plan Benefits
Docket No. 16-0310-1807
Notice of Rulemaking — Temporary and Proposed Rule............ccoecveviiriiniecienieiiiieie e 222

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 4 October 3, 2018 - Vol. 18-10



IDAHO ADMINISTRATIVE BULLETIN Table of Contents

16.05.04 — Rules of the Idaho Council on Domestic Violence
and Victim Assistance Grant Funding

Docket No. 16-0504-1801
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE .........c.cccoeviiriiiieiiieeee e 225

16.05.06 — Criminal History and Background Checks
Docket No. 16-0506-1801

Notice of Rulemaking —
Adoption of Pending Rule and Amendment to Temporary Rule..........ccoocvvveviiienienienienieieeeenn, 227

IDAPA 17 — IDAHO INDUSTRIAL COMMISSION
17.02.06 — Employers’ Reports
Docket No. 17-0206-1801
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RuULe ..........cooiiiiiiiiiiiiiieeee e 230

17.02.07 — Procedures to Obtain Compensation
Docket No. 17-0207-1801
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE .........c.coieiiiiiiiiiiciiicice et 233

17.02.10 — Administrative Rules of the Industrial Commission Under the Workers’
Compensation Law — Security for Compensation — Insurance Carriers

Docket No. 17-0210-1801

Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIe ...........cccooiiiiiiiiiiie e 237
Docket No. 17-0210-1802
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RULE .........c.cccieviiiiiiieiiiiiiecict et 241

17.02.11 — Administrative Rules of the Industrial Commission Under the Workers’
Compensation Law — Security for Compensation — Self-Insured Employers

Docket No. 17-0211-1801

Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE ...........cccooiiiiiiiiiiiiic e 249
Docket No. 17-0211-1802
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RULE .........c.ccieviiiiiieiiiiieiecct et 253

IDAPA 18 — IDAHO DEPARTMENT OF INSURANCE

18.01.30 — Individual Disability and Group Supplemental Disability
Insurance Minimum Standards Rule

Docket No. 18-0130-1801
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RULE .........c.cccviviiiiieiieiiiiisieeeeee et 260

18.01.54 — Rule to Implement the NAIC Medicare Supplement Insurance
Minimum Standards Model Act

Docket No. 18-0154-1802
Notice of Rulemaking — Adoption of Temporary Rule............cccoiiriiiniiiiiii e 263
18.01.70 — Rules Governing Small Employer Health Insurance
Availability Act Plan Design
Docket No. 18-0170-1801
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE .........c.cccoeviirieiieiiieecceeeeee e 265

IDAPA 24 — BUREAU OF OCCUPATIONAL LICENSES
24.03.01 — Rules of the State Board of Chiropractic Physicians
Docket No. 24-0301-1801
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE .........c.cccieiiiiiiieiiiiiiecceee et 269

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 5 October 3, 2018 - Vol. 18-10



IDAHO ADMINISTRATIVE BULLETIN Table of Contents

24.05.01 — Rules of the Board of Drinking Water and Wastewater Professionals
Docket No. 24-0501-1801
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE .........c.cccieviiiiiieiiiieiccceec e

24.06.01 — Rules for the Licensure of Occupational Therapists
and Occupational Therapy Assistants

Docket No. 24-0601-1801
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE ...........cocooiiiiiiiiiiie e

24.08.01 — Rules of the State Board of Morticians
Docket No. 24-0801-1801
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RULE .........c.ccveiiiiieiiiiiiiiiciee e

24.09.01 — Rules of the Board of Examiners of Nursing Home Administrators
Docket No. 24-0901-1802
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE .........c.cccoiviiriiiieniieeeee e

24.11.01 — Rules of the State Board of Podiatry
Docket No. 24-1101-1801
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE ...........cccooiiiiiiiiiiiiie e

24.12.01 — Rules of the Idaho State Board of Psychologist Examiners
Docket No. 24-1201-1801
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE .........c.cccveviiiieieiiciiiecce et

Docket No. 24-1201-1802 (Fee Rule)
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE .........c.cocieiirieieiieeeeee e

24.13.01 — Rules Governing the Physical Therapy Licensure Board
Docket No. 24-1301-1801
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE .........cccoeiiiiiieiiiie et

24.14.01 — Rules of the State Board of Social Work Examiners
Docket No. 24-1401-1801
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE .........c.cccveviiriieieiiiiieeieteee e

24.15.01 — Rules of the Idaho Licensing Board of Professional Counselors
and Marriage and Family Therapists

Docket No. 24-1501-1802
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE ...........cocooiiiiiiiiiieeeeee e

24.17.01 — Rules of the State Board of Acupuncture
Docket No. 24-1701-1801
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RULE .........c.cocviviiiiieieiiiiisieceeeetee et

24.18.01 — Rules of the Real Estate Appraiser Board
Docket No. 24-1801-1802 (Fee Rule)
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE .........c.ccieviiriiiiiiiiiieeeeeeee e

24.19.01 — Rules of the Board of Examiners of Residential
Care Facility Administrators

Docket No. 24-1901-1801
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RULE .........c.cccveviiiiiiiiiiiecieee et

24.25.01 — Rules of the Idaho Driving Businesses Licensure Board
Docket No. 24-2501-1801
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RULE .........c.cccoeviiriiiieiiieiceeeeeee e

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 6 October 3, 2018 - Vol. 18-10



IDAHO ADMINISTRATIVE BULLETIN Table of Contents

24.26.01 — Rules of the Idaho Board of Midwifery
Docket No. 24-2601-1801
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE .........c.cccieviiiiiieiiiieiccceec e 345

24.28.01 — Rules of the Barber and Cosmetology Services Licensing Board
Docket No. 24-2801-1802 (New Chapter, Fee Rule)
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE .........c.cccieiiriieiieiieeieee e 349

IDAPA 26 - DEPARTMENT OF PARKS AND RECREATION

26.01.10 — Rules Governing the Administration of Temporary Permits
on Lands Owned by the Idaho Department of Parks and Recreation

Docket No. 26-0110-1701
Notice of Rulemaking — Adoption of Pending Fee Rule.........c.cccoeieriieiinincierieeee e 376

26.01.20 — Rules Governing the Administration of Park
and Recreation Areas and Facilities

Docket No. 26-0120-1701
Notice of Rulemaking — Adoption of Pending RUIE ..........c..coceeeiieiiriiiiiiiiee e 377

26.01.23 — Rules Governing Filming Within Idaho State Parks
Docket No. 26-0123-1701
Notice of Rulemaking — Adoption of Pending RUIE ..........cccoccieiieiiiiiniiiee e 378

IDAPA 27 - BOARD OF PHARMACY
27.01.01 — General Provisions
Docket No. 27-0101-1801
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE .........c.coveiiriiiieiiiiiiiiciceetee e 379

27.01.02 — Rules Governing Licensure and Registration
Docket No. 27-0102-1802 (Fee Rule)
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE .........c.cccooiiriiiieiicieeceeee e 385

27.01.03 — Rules Governing Pharmacy Practice
Docket No. 27-0103-1801

Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RuUle ...........ooiiiiiiiiiiiiieie e 390
Docket No. 27-0103-1802
Notice of Rulemaking — Adoption of Temporary Rule............ccccovirviinieiiniiieiecieceee e 400

27.01.04 — Rules Governing Pharmacist Prescriptive Authority
Docket No. 27-0104-1802
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE .........c.ccieiiriiiieiiiieece e 402

27.01.05 — Rules Governing Drug Compounding
Docket No. 27-0105-1801
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RULE ..........ccooiiiiiiiiiii e 405

27.01.06 — Rules Governing DME, Manufacturing, and Distribution
Docket No. 27-0106-1801 (Chapter Repeal)
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE .........c.cccieiiriiiieiiiiiiiciceetes et 409

IDAPA 28 - DEPARTMENT OF COMMERCE
28.02.03 — Rules of the Idaho Regional Travel and Convention Grant Program
Docket No. 28-0203-1802
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RULE ..........cooiiiiiiiiiii e 411

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 7 October 3, 2018 - Vol. 18-10



IDAHO ADMINISTRATIVE BULLETIN Table of Contents

IDAPA 29 — IDAHO POTATO COMMISSION

29.01.03 — Rules Governing Nominations for Appointment as a Commissioner
to the Idaho Potato Commission

Docket No. 29-0103-1802
Notice of Rulemaking — Adoption of Temporary Rule..........ccccccouiviririnninininenceneneceeeeeeeenene 415

IDAPA 31 - IDAHO PUBLIC UTILITIES COMMISSION

31.11.01 — Safety and Accident Reporting Rules for Utilities
Regulated by the Idaho Public Utilities Commission

Docket No. 31-1101-1801
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE .........c.cccoeviiriieiieiieeieee et 419

31.71.03 — Railroad Safety and Accident Reporting Rules
Docket No. 31-7103-1801
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIe ...........cocooiiiiiiiiiiiiie e 421

IDAPA 35— STATE TAX COMMISSION
35.01.01 — Income Tax Administrative Rules
Docket No. 35-0101-1804
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE .........c.cccveiiriieiiiiiiiiecce e 423

35.01.02 — Idaho Sales and Use Tax Administrative Rules
Docket No. 35-0102-1802

Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RuULe ..........cooiiiiiiiiiiiiiiieee e 426
Docket No. 35-0102-1803
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE .........c.cccieiiiiiiieiiiiiiicicceee et 432

35.01.03 — Property Tax Administrative Rules
Docket No. 35-0103-1801
Notice of Correction:
Correction to Notice of Proposed Rulemaking ...........ccccocveviiriiiiniiniiniiniiieeee e 450

35.02.01 — Tax Commission Administration and Enforcement Rules
Docket No. 35-0201-1801
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE .........c.cccveiiiiiiiiiiiiiiciceee e 451

IDAPA 38 - DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION
38.05.01 — Rules of the Division of Purchasing
Docket No. 38-0501-1801
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RULE ...........ooiiiiiiiiiiieeeeeeee e 454

IDAPA 39 — IDAHO TRANSPORTATION DEPARTMENT
39.03.01 — Rules Governing Definitions Regarding Overlegal Permits
Docket No. 39-0301-1801 (Chapter Repeal)
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE ..........ccoeciiiiiiiiiiiiieicese et 465

39.03.01 — Rules Governing Definitions Regarding Special Permits
Docket No. 39-0301-1802 (New Chapter)
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE ...........ccoeiiiiiiiiiie e 466

39.03.02 — Rules Governing Movement of Disabled Vehicles
Docket No. 39-0302-1801 (New Chapter)
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE .........c.cocieviiviiiiiniiiiiiiciccceet et 472

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 8 October 3, 2018 - Vol. 18-10



IDAHO ADMINISTRATIVE BULLETIN Table of Contents

39.03.03 — Rules Governing Special Permits — General Conditions and Requirements
Docket No. 39-0303-1801 (New Chapter, Fee Rule)
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE .........c.cccoeiiriiiiieiiieeeeeee e

39.03.04 — Rules Governing Movement of Disabled Vehicles
Docket No. 39-0304-1801 (Chapter Repeal)
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUle ...........cccooiiiiiiiiiiiiiie e

39.03.04 — Rules Governing Special Permits — Overweight Non-Reducible
Docket No. 39-0304-1802 (New Chapter)
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RULE .........c.coieviiiiieieiiiiiicccceeeee et

39.03.05 — Rule Governing Variable Load Suspension Axles
Docket No. 39-0305-1801 (Chapter Repeal)
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RULE .........c.cccieiiriieiieiiieeeee e

39.03.05 — Rules Governing Special Permits — Oversize Non-Reducible
Docket No. 39-0305-1802 (New Chapter)
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE ...........cccooiiiiiiiiiiiiiice e

39.03.06 — Rules Governing Allowable Vehicle Size
Docket No. 39-0306-1801 (Chapter Repeal)
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE .........c.cccieviiiiiieiiiiisieceeeeeee et

39.03.06 — Rules Governing Special Permits for Extra-Length/Excess Weight,
Up to 129,000 Pound Vehicle Combinations

Docket No. 39-0306-1802 (New Chapter)
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE ...........cccooiiiiiiiiiiiieee e

39.03.07 — Rules Governing Restricted Routes for Semitrailers
Docket No. 39-0307-1801 (Chapter Repeal)
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RULE .........c.cccveiiriieieiiiiesicccce et

39.03.07 — Rules Governing Special Permits for Reducible Loads
Docket No. 39-0307-1802 (New Chapter)
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE .........c.ccciiviiriiiieiiieeceece e

39.03.08 — Rules Governing Self-Propelled Snowplows
Docket No. 39-0308-1801 (New Chapter)
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE ...........ccoeiiiiiiiiiiee e

39.03.09 — Rules Governing Overlegal Permits —
General Conditions and Requirements

Docket No. 39-0309-1801 (Chapter Repeal)
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE .........c.cccieviiriiiiieiiiecceeeee et

39.03.10 — Rules Governing When an Overlegal Permit is Required
Docket No. 39-0310-1801 (Chapter Repeal)
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RULe ...........cocoeiiiiiiiiiiiee e

39.03.11 — Rules Governing Overlegal Permittee Responsibility
and Travel Restrictions

Docket No. 39-0311-1801 (Chapter Repeal)
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE .........c.cccveviiriiiieiiiieieee e

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 9 October 3, 2018 - Vol. 18-10



IDAHO ADMINISTRATIVE BULLETIN Table of Contents

39.03.12 — Rules Governing Safety Requirements of Overlegal Permits
Docket No. 39-0312-1801 (Chapter Repeal)
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE .........c.cccveviiriiiieiiiieecee e

39.03.13 — Rules Governing Overweight Permits
Docket No. 39-0313-1801 (Chapter Repeal)
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE ...........cocooiiiiiiiiiiiiie e

39.03.14 — Rules Governing Policy During Spring Breakup Season
Docket No. 39-0314-1801 (Chapter Repeal)
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE .........c.cocveiiriiiieiiiiiicee et

39.03.15 — Rules Governing Excess Weight Permits for Reducible Loads
Docket No. 39-0315-1801 (Chapter Repeal)
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE .........c.cccoeiiiriiiieiiieecee et

39.03.16 — Rules Governing Oversize Permits for
Non-Reducible Vehicles and/or Loads

Docket No. 39-0316-1801 (Chapter Repeal)
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RULE .........c.cocveviiiiiiieiiiiiicccceee et

39.03.17 — Rules Governing Permits for Manufactured Homes,
Modular Buildings, and Office Trailers

Docket No. 39-0317-1801 (Chapter Repeal)
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIe ...........cccooiiiiiiiiiiiie e

39.03.18 — Rules Governing Overlegal Permits for
Relocation of Buildings or Houses

Docket No. 39-0318-1801 (Chapter Repeal)
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE .........c.cccieviiriiiiieiiieeeee e

39.03.19 — Rules Governing Annual Overlegal Permits
Docket No. 39-0319-1801 (Chapter Repeal)
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIe ...........cccooiiiiiiiiiiii e

39.03.20 — Rules Governing Application for Special Permits
Docket No. 39-0320-1801 (Chapter Repeal)
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE .........c.cccveviiiiieieiiiiiiccece et

39.03.21 — Rules Governing Overlegal Permit Fees
Docket No. 39-0321-1801 (Chapter Repeal)
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE .........c.cocieiiriiiiiiieieeeee e
39.03.22 — Rules Governing Overlegal Permits for Extra-Length,
Excess Weight, and Up to 129,000 Pound Vehicle Combinations
Docket No. 39-0322-1801 (Chapter Repeal)
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE .........c.cccveiiiiiiiiiiiiiiceccee et

39.03.23 — Rules Governing Revocation of Overlegal Permits
Docket No. 39-0323-1801 (Chapter Repeal)
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RULE .........c.cccieiiriiiiieiiiieecee e

39.03.24 — Rules Governing Self-Propelled Snowplows
Docket No. 39-0324-1801 (Chapter Repeal)
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE ...........cocoeiiiiiiiiiiee e

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 10 October 3, 2018 - Vol. 18-10



IDAHO ADMINISTRATIVE BULLETIN Table of Contents

39.03.25 — Rules Governing Lights on Snow Removal Equipment
Docket No. 39-0325-1801 (Chapter Repeal)
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE .........c.ccoveviiiiiiiiiiieicceeee e 542

IDAPA 47 — DIVISION OF VOCATIONAL REHABILITATION
47.01.02 — Rules and Minimum Standards Governing Extended Employment Services
Docket No. 47-0102-1801
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RuUle ...........ocoiiiiiiiiiiiiiiieee e 543

IDAPA 49 — CERTIFIED SHORTHAND REPORTERS BOARD
49.01.01 — Rules of Procedure of the Idaho Certified Shorthand Reporters Board
Docket No. 49-0101-1801
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE .........c.cccieiiriiiieiiceecce e 552

IDAPA 55 — DIVISION OF CAREER TECHNICAL EDUCATION
55.01.03 — Rules of Career Technical Schools
Docket No. 55-0103-1801
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE .........c.cocieiiiiiiieiiiiicieeiceetes et 554

IDAPA 58 - DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY

Salt River Watershed Assessment and Total Maximum Daily Load (TMDL):
2018 (HUC ID 17040105)

Docket No. 58-0000-1803
NOICE OF FINAL DECISION......coiuviiiiiiiiiieeeciee ettt eeee e et e ettt e e eae e e eae e e e eteeeeeaaeesenaeeeenaeeeenneesaneeeas 558

IDAPA 59 — PUBLIC EMPLOYEES RETIREMENT SYSTEM OF IDAHO
59.01.06 — PERSI Retirement Rules
Docket No. 59-0106-1802
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RULe ..........cooiiiiiiiiiiiiieeeee e 559

IDAPA 60 — IDAHO STATE SOIL AND WATER CONSERVATION COMMISSION
60.05.01 — Resource Conservation and Rangeland Development Program
Docket No. 60-0501-1801
Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE ..........cccoeciiiiiiiiiiiiieieeeeee et 561

IDAPA 61 - STATE PUBLIC DEFENSE COMMISSION

61.01.04 — Rules Governing Procedures and Forms for the Application
and Disbursement of Indigent Defense Grants

Docket No. 61-0104-1801 (New Chapter)

Notice of Rulemaking — Proposed RUIE .........c.cccieviiriiiiieiiiecceeeee et 572
SECTIONS AFFECTED INDEX ...ttt ettt et s et a et e s sesene e 578
LEGAL NOTICE - SUMMARY OF PROPOSED RULEMAKINGS ............cccoooviiiiimniiininneccenneeeeneae 596
CUMULATIVE RULEMAKING INDEX

OF IDAHO ADMINISTRATIVE RULES ...ttt 604
SUBUJUECT INDEX .........coooiiiiiiimiiieiineiee ettt sttt ettt ettt ettt et 625

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 11 October 3, 2018 - Vol. 18-10



PREFACE

The Idaho Administrative Bulletin is an electronic-only, online monthly publication of the Office of the
Administrative Rules Coordinator, Department of Administration, that is published pursuant to Section 67-5203,
Idaho Code. The Bulletin is a compilation of all official rulemaking notices, official rule text, executive orders of the
Governor, and all legislative documents affecting rules that are statutorily required to be published in the Bulletin. It
may also include other rules-related documents an agency may want to make public through the Bulletin.

State agencies are required to provide public notice of all rulemaking actions and must invite public input. This is
done through negotiated rulemaking procedures or after proposed rulemaking has been initiated. The public receives
notice that an agency has initiated proposed rulemaking procedures through the Idaho Administrative Bulletin and a
legal notice (Public Notice of Intent) that publishes in authorized newspapers throughout the state. The legal notice
provides reasonable opportunity for the public to participate when a proposed rule publishes in the Bulletin.
Interested parties may submit written comments to the agency or request public hearings of the agency, if none have
been scheduled. Such submissions or requests must be presented to the agency within the time and manner specified
in the individual “Notice of Rulemaking - Proposed Rule” for each proposed rule that is published in the Bulletin.

Once the comment period closes, the agency considers fully all comments and information submitted regarding
the proposed rule. Changes may be made to the proposed rule at this stage of the rulemaking, but changes must be
based on comments received and must be a “logical outgrowth” of the proposed rule. The agency may now adopt and
publish the pending rule. A pending rule is “pending” legislative review for final approval. The pending rule is the
agency’s final version of the rulemaking that will be forwarded to the legislature for review and final approval.
Comment periods and public hearings are not provided for when the agency adopts a temporary or pending rule.

CITATION TO THE IDAHO ADMINISTRATIVE BULLETIN

The Bulletin is identified by the calendar year and issue number. For example, Bulletin 13-1 refers to the first
Bulletin issued in calendar year 2013; Bulletin 14-1 refers to the first Bulletin issued in calendar year 2014. Volume
numbers, which proceed from 1 to 12 in a given year, correspond to the months of publication, i.e.; Volume No. 13-1
refers to January 2013; Volume No. 13-2 refers to February 2013; and so forth. Example: The Bulletin published in
January 2014 is cited as Volume 14-1. The December 2015 Bulletin is cited as Volume 15-12.

RELATIONSHIP TO THE IDAHO ADMINISTRATIVE CODE

The Idaho Administrative Code is an electronic-only, online compilation of all final and enforceable
administrative rules of the state of Idaho that are of full force and effect. Any temporary rule that is adopted by an
agency and is of force and effect is codified into the Administrative Code upon becoming effective. All pending rules
that have been approved by the legislature during the legislative session as final rules and any temporary rules that are
extended supplement the Administrative Code. These rules are codified into the Administrative Code upon becoming
effective. Because proposed and pending rules are not enforceable, they are published in the Administrative Bulletin
only and cannot be codified into the Administrative Code until approved as final.

To determine if a particular rule remains in effect or whether any amendments have been made to the rule, refer
to the Cumulative Rulemaking Index. Link to it on the Administrative Rules homepage at adminrules.idaho.gov.

THE DIFFERENT RULES PUBLISHED IN THE ADMINISTRATIVE BULLETIN

Idaho’s administrative rulemaking process, governed by the Administrative Procedure Act, Title 67, Chapter 52,
Idaho Code, comprises distinct rulemaking actions: negotiated, proposed, temporary, pending and final rulemaking.
Not all rulemakings incorporate or require all of these actions. At a minimum, a rulemaking includes proposed,
pending and final rulemaking. Many rules are adopted as temporary rules when they meet the required statutory
criteria and agencies must, when feasible, engage in negotiated rulemaking at the beginning of the process to
facilitate consensus building. In the majority of cases, the process begins with proposed rulemaking and ends with the
final rulemaking. The following is a brief explanation of each type of rule.

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 12 October 3, 2018 - Vol. 18-10


http://adminrules.idaho.gov

IDAHO ADMINISTRATIVE BULLETIN PREFACE

1. NEGOTIATED RULEMAKING

Negotiated rulemaking is a process in which all interested persons and the agency seek consensus on the content
of a rule through dialogue. Agencies are required to conduct negotiated rulemaking whenever it is feasible to do so.
The agency files a “Notice of Intent to Promulgate - Negotiated Rulemaking” for publication in the Administrative
Bulletin inviting interested persons to contact the agency if interested in discussing the agency’s intentions regarding
the rule changes. This process is intended to result in the formulation of a proposed rule and the initiation of regular
rulemaking procedures. One result, however, may also be that regular (proposed) rulemaking is not initiated and no
further action is taken by the agency.

2. PROPOSED RULEMAKING

A proposed rulemaking is an action by an agency wherein the agency is proposing to amend or repeal an existing
rule or to adopt a new rule. Prior to the adoption, amendment, or repeal of a rule, the agency must publish a “Notice
of Rulemaking - Proposed Rule” in the Bulletin. This notice must include very specific information regarding the
rulemaking including all relevant state or federal statutory authority occasioning the rulemaking, a non-technical
description of the changes being made, any associated costs, guidance on how to participate through submission of
written comments and requests for public hearings, and the text of the proposed rule in legislative format.

3. TEMPORARY RULEMAKING
Temporary rules may be adopted only when the governor finds that it is necessary for:

a) protection of the public health, safety, or welfare; or
b) compliance with deadlines in amendments to governing law or federal programs; or
c) conferring a benefit.

If a rulemaking meets one or more of these criteria, and with the Governor’s approval, the agency may adopt and
make a temporary rule effective prior to receiving legislative authorization and without allowing for any public input.
The law allows an agency to make a temporary rule immediately effective upon adoption. A temporary rule expires
at the conclusion of the next succeeding regular legislative session unless the rule is extended by concurrent
resolution, is replaced by a final rule, or expires under its own terms.

4. PENDING RULEMAKING

A pending rule is a rule that has been adopted by an agency under regular rulemaking procedures and remains
subject to legislative review before it becomes a final, enforceable rule. When a pending rule is published in the
Bulletin, the agency is required to include certain information in the “Notice of Rulemaking - Pending Rule.” This
includes a statement giving the reasons for adopting the rule, a statement regarding when the rule becomes effective,
a description of how it differs from the proposed rule, and identification of any fees being imposed or changed.

Agencies are required to republish the text of the pending rule when substantive changes have been made to the
proposed rule. An agency may adopt a pending rule that varies in content from that which was originally proposed if
the subject matter of the rule remains the same, the pending rule change is a logical outgrowth of the proposed rule,
and the original notice was written so as to assure that members of the public were reasonably notified of the subject.
It is not always necessary to republish all the text of the pending rule.

5. FINAL RULEMAKING

A final rule is a rule that has been adopted by an agency under the regular rulemaking procedures and is of full
force and effect.

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 13 October 3, 2018 - Vol. 18-10



IDAHO ADMINISTRATIVE BULLETIN PREFACE

HOW TO USE THE IDAHO ADMINISTRATIVE BULLETIN

Rulemaking documents produced by state agencies and published in the Idaho Administrative Bulletin are
organized by a numbering schematic. Each state agency has a two-digit identification code number known as the
“IDAPA” number. (The “IDAPA” Codes are listed in the alphabetical/numerical index at the end of this Preface.)
Within each agency there are divisions or departments to which a two-digit “TITLE” number is assigned. There are
“CHAPTER” numbers assigned within the Title and the rule text is divided among major sections that are further
subdivided into subsections. An example IDAPA number is as follows:

IDAPA 38.05.01.200.02.c.ii.

“IDAPA” refers to Administrative Rules in general that are subject to the Administrative Procedures Act and are
required by this act to be published in the Idaho Administrative Code and the Idaho Administrative Bulletin.

1. “38.” refers to the Idaho Department of Administration
“05.” refers to Title 05, which is the Department of Administration’s Division of Purchasing
“01.” refers to Chapter 01 of Title 05, “Rules of the Division of Purchasing”
“200.” refers to Major Section 200, “Content of the Invitation to Bid”
“02.” refers to Subsection 200.02.
“c.” refers to Subsection 200.02.c.

“ii.” refers to Subsection 200.02.c.ii.

DOCKET NUMBERING SYSTEM

Internally, the Bulletin is organized sequentially using a rule docketing system. Each rulemaking that is filed with
the Coordinator is assigned a “DOCKET NUMBER.” The docket number is a series of numbers separated by a
hyphen “-”, (38-0501-1401). Rulemaking dockets are published sequentially by IDAPA number (the two-digit
agency code) in the Bulletin. The following example is a breakdown of a typical rule docket number:

“DOCKET NO. 38-0501-1401”

¢“38-" denotes the agency's IDAPA number; in this case the Department of Administration.

“0501-" refers to the TITLE AND CHAPTER numbers of the agency rule being promulgated; in this case the
Division of Purchasing (TITLE 05), Rules of the Division of Purchasing (Chapter 01).

“1401” denotes the year and sequential order of the docket being published; in this case the numbers refer to the
first rulemaking action published in calendar year 2014. A subsequent rulemaking on this same rule chapter in
calendar year 2014 would be designated as “1402”. The docket number in this scenario would be 38-0501-1402.

Within each Docket, only the affected sections of chapters are printed. (See Sections Affected Index in each
Bulletin for a listing of these.) The individual sections affected are printed in the Bulletin sequentially (e.g. Section
“200” appears before Section “345” and so on). Whenever the sequence of the numbering is broken the following
statement will appear:

(BREAK IN CONTINUITY OF SECTIONS)

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 14 October 3, 2018 - Vol. 18-10



IDAHO ADMINISTRATIVE BULLETIN

PREFACE

BULLETIN PUBLICATION SCHEDULE FOR CALENDAR YEAR 2018

Vol. Monthly Issue Closing Date for Publication Date 21-day Comment

No. of Bulletin Agency Filing Period End Date
18-1 January 2018 *November 24, 2017 January 3, 2018 January 24, 2018
18-2 February 2018 January 5, 2018 February 7, 2018 February 28, 2018
18-3 March 2018 February 2, 2018 March 7, 2018 March 28, 2018
18-4 April 2018 March 2, 2018 April 4, 2018 April 25, 2018
18-5 May 2018 April 6, 2018 May 2, 2018 May 23, 2018
18-6 June 2018 May 4, 2018 June 6, 2018 June 27, 2018
18-7 July 2018 June 8, 2018 July 4, 2018 July 25, 2018
18-8 August 2018 July 6, 2018 August 1, 2018 August 22, 2018
18-9 September 2018 August 3, 2018 September 5, 2018 September 26, 2018
18-10 October 2018 **August 31, 2018 October 3, 2018 October 24, 2018
18-11 November 2018 October 5, 2018 November 7, 2018 November 28, 2018
18-12 December 2018 November 2, 2018 December 5, 2018 December 26, 2018

BULLETIN PUBLICATION SCHEDULE FOR CALENDAR YEAR 2019

ol | Moyl  Clsnadzelr  puicainowe | ZhdeCommen
19-1 January 2019 *November 30, 2018 January 2, 2019 January 23, 2019
19-2 February 2019 January 4, 2019 February 6, 2019 February 27, 2019
19-3 March 2019 February 8, 2019 March 6, 2019 March 27, 2019
19-4 April 2019 March 8, 2019 April 3, 2019 April 24, 2019
19-5 May 2019 April 5, 2019 May 1, 2019 May 22, 2019
19-6 June 2019 May 3, 2019 June 5, 2019 June 26, 2019
19-7 July 2019 June 7, 2019 July 3, 2019 July 24, 2019
19-8 August 2019 July 5, 2019 August 7, 2019 August 28, 2019
19-9 September 2019 August 2, 2019 September 4, 2019 September 25, 2019
19-10 October 2019 **August 30, 2019 October 2, 2019 October 23, 2019
19-11 November 2019 October 4, 2019 November 6, 2019 November 27, 2019
19-12 December 2019 November 1, 2019 December 4, 2019 December 25, 2018

*Last day to submit a proposed rulemaking before moratorium begins and
last day to submit a pending rule to be reviewed by the legislature.

**| ast day to submit a proposed rule in order to have the rulemaking

completed and submitted for review by legislature.

Idaho Administrative Bulletin

Page 15

October 3, 2018 - Vol. 18-10



IDAHO ADMINISTRATIVE BULLETIN

PREFACE

ALPHABETICAL INDEX OF STATE AGENCIES
AND CORRESPONDING IDAPA NUMBERS

IDAPA 01 Accountancy, Board of
IDAPA 38 Administration, Department of
IDAPA 44 Administrative Rules Coordinator, Office of the
IDAPA 02 Agriculture, Idaho Department of
IDAPA 40 Arts, Idaho Commission on the
IDAPA 03 Athletic Commission
IDAPA 04 Attorney General, Office of the
IDAPA 53 Barley Commission, Idaho
IDAPA 51 Beef Council, Idaho
IDAPA 07 Building Safety, Division of

Electrical Board (07.01)

Plumbing Board (07.02)

Building Codes & Manufactured Homes (07.03)

Building Code Advisory Board (07.03.01)

Public Works Contractors License Board (07.05)

Uniform School Building Safety (07.06)

HVAC Board (07.07)
IDAPA 43 Canola and Rapeseed Commission, Idaho
IDAPA 55 Career-Technical Education, Division of
IDAPA 28 Commerce, Idaho Department of
IDAPA 06 Correction, Board of
IDAPA 19 Dentistry, Board of
IDAPA 08 Education, State Board of and State Department of
IDAPA 10 Engineers and Land Surveyors, Board of Professional
IDAPA 58 Environmental Quality, Department of
IDAPA 12 Finance, Department of
IDAPA 13 Fish and Game, Department of
IDAPA 14 Geologists, Board of Registration for Professional

Idaho Administrative Bulletin

Page 16 October 3, 2018 - Vol. 18-10



IDAHO ADMINISTRATIVE BULLETIN

PREFACE

ALPHABETICAL INDEX OF STATE AGENCIES
AND CORRESPONDING IDAPA NUMBERS
IDAPA 15 Governor, Office of the
Idaho Commission on Aging (15.01)
Idaho Commission for the Blind and Visually Impaired (15.02)
Idaho Forest Products Commission (15.03)
Division of Human Resources and Personnel Commission 15.04)
Idaho Liquor Division (15.10)
Idaho Military Division
(Division of Homeland Security) (15.06)
IDAPA 48 Grape Growers and Wine Producers Commission, Idaho
IDAPA 16 Health and Welfare, Department of
IDAPA 41 Health Districts, Public
IDAPA 45 Human Rights Commission
IDAPA 17 Industrial Commission
IDAPA 18 Insurance, Department of
IDAPA 05 Juvenile Corrections, Department of
IDAPA 09 Labor, Idaho Department of
IDAPA 20 Lands, Department of
IDAPA 30 Libraries, Commission for
IDAPA 52 Lottery Commission, Idaho State
IDAPA 22 Medicine, Board of
IDAPA 23 Nursing, Board of

Idaho Administrative Bulletin

Page 17 October 3, 2018 - Vol. 18-10



IDAHO ADMINISTRATIVE BULLETIN PREFACE

ALPHABETICAL INDEX OF STATE AGENCIES
AND CORRESPONDING IDAPA NUMBERS

IDAPA 24

Occupational Licenses, Board of (24.20)
Acupuncture, Board of (24.17)
Architectural Examiners, Board of (24.01)
Barber Examiners, Board of (24.02)
Chiropractic Physicians, Board of (24.03)
Contractors Board, Idaho (24.21)
Cosmetology, Board of (24.04)
Counselors and Marriage and Family Therapists, Licensing Board of Professional (24.15)
Denturity, Board of (24.16)
Drinking Water and Wastewater Professionals, Board of (24.05)
Driving Businesses Licensure Board, State (24.25)
Landscape Architects, Board of (24.07)
Liquefied Petroleum Gas Safety Board (24.22)
Massage Therapy, Board of (24.27)
Midwifery, State Board of (24.26)
Morticians, Board of (24.08)
Nursing Home Administrators, Board of Examiners of (24.09)
Occupational Therapy Licensure Board, State (24.06)
Optometry, Board of (24.10)
Physical Therapy Licensure Board (24.13)
Podiatry, Board of (24.11)
Psychologist Examiners, Board of (24.12)
Real Estate Appraiser Board (24.18)
Residential Care Facility Administrators, Board of Examiners of (24.19)
Social Work Examiners, Board of (24.14)
Speech and Hearing Services Board (24.23)

IDAPA 25

Outfitters and Guides Licensing Board

IDAPA 50

Pardons and Parole, Commission for

IDAPA 26

Parks and Recreation, Department of

IDAPA 27

Pharmacy, Board of

IDAPA 11

Police, Idaho State

IDAPA 29

Potato Commission, Idaho

IDAPA 61

Public Defense Commission, State

IDAPA 59

Public Employee Retirement System of Idaho (PERSI)

IDAPA 31

Public Utilities Commission

IDAPA 56

Rangeland Resources Commission, Idaho

IDAPA 33

Real Estate Commission, Idaho

IDAPA 34

Secretary of State, Office of the

IDAPA 57

Sexual Offender Management Board

IDAPA 49

Shorthand Reporters Board, Idaho Certified

IDAPA 60

Soil and Water Conservation Commission, Idaho State

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 18 October 3, 2018 - Vol. 18-10



IDAHO ADMINISTRATIVE BULLETIN PREFACE

ALPHABETICAL INDEX OF STATE AGENCIES
AND CORRESPONDING IDAPA NUMBERS
IDAPA 36 Tax Appeals, Board of
IDAPA 35 Tax Commission, State
IDAPA 39 Transportation Department, Idaho
IDAPA 54 Treasurer, Office of the State
IDAPA 21 Veterans Services, Division of
IDAPA 46 Veterinary Medical Examiners, Board of
IDAPA 47 Vocational Rehabilitation, Division of
IDAPA 37 Water Resources, Department of
IDAPA 42 Wheat Commission

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 19 October 3, 2018 - Vol. 18-10



IDAPA 02 - DEPARTMENT OF AGRICULTURE
02.04.14 - RULES GOVERNING DAIRY BYPRODUCT
DOCKET NO. 02-0414-1801
(SECOND) NOTICE OF INTENT TO PROMULGATE RULES — NEGOTIATED RULEMAKING

AUTHORITY: In compliance with Sections 67-5220(1) and 67-5220(2), Idaho Code, notice is hereby given that this
agency intends to promulgate rules and desires public comment prior to initiating formal rulemaking procedures. This
negotiated rulemaking action is authorized pursuant to Section 37-603, Idaho Code.

MEETING SCHEDULE: Additional public meetings on the negotiated rulemaking will be held as follows:

PUBLIC MEETINGS - NEGOTIATED RULEMAKING

2nd Tuesday of Each Month —10:00 a.m. (MST)
1st meeting will occur on Tuesday, November 13 at 10:00 a.m.

Idaho State Department of Agriculture
2270 Old Penitentiary Road
Boise, ID 83712

The meeting site will be accessible to persons with disabilities, if needed. Requests for accommodation must be
made not later than five (5) days prior to the meeting to the agency address below.

METHOD OF PARTICIPATION: Persons wishing to participate in the negotiated rulemaking must do the following:

Interested members of the public who wish to participate must submit any written comments, questions,
recommendations, or ideas to the Idaho State Department of Agriculture addressed to Dr. Scott Leibsle, Deputy
Administrator, Division of Animal Industries. Individuals may also attend the public meeting to be conducted on the above
date during which the Idaho State Department of Agriculture will allow oral comments or presentations to be made.

Upon conclusion of the negotiated rulemaking, any unresolved issues, all key issues considered, and conclusion
reached during the negotiated rulemaking will be addressed in a written summary and made available on the agency website.

DESCRIPTIVE SUMMARY AND STATEMENT OF PURPOSE: The following is a statement in nontechnical
language of the substance and purpose of the intended negotiated rulemaking and the principle issues involved:

This rule change is a result of two petitions submitted to amend this rule. The first petition, received from the
Milk Producers of Idaho and Idaho Farm Bureau, seeks to remove the sunset clause from Section 004.31 and allow
dairy producers the option to select either phosphorus indexing or phosphorus threshold to monitor dairy nutrient
management. The second petition, received from the Idaho Dairymen’s Association, seeks for a margin of error to be
provided for in the enforcement standards for phosphorus levels permitted in the soil. The margin of error is meant to
compensate for the variability of currently laboratory soil testing methods. Incorporation of the NRCS Nutrient
Management Code 590 reference document for phosphorus regulation will also be addressed in this negotiation.

ASSISTANCE ON TECHNICAL QUESTIONS, SUBMISSION OF WRITTEN COMMENTS, OBTAINING
DRAFT COPIES: For assistance on technical questions concerning this negotiated rulemaking or to obtain a copy of
the preliminary draft of the text of the proposed rule, contact Dr. Scott Leibsle, Deputy Administrator — Division of
Animal Industries at (208) 332-8540. Materials pertaining to the negotiated rulemaking, including any available
preliminary rule drafts, and additional meeting information can be found on the ISDA web site www.agri.idaho.gov.

Anyone may submit written comments regarding this negotiated rulemaking. All written comments must be
directed to Dr. Scott Leibsle.

Dated this 4th day of September, 2018.

Brian J. Oakey, Deputy Director 2270 Old Penitentiary Rd.
Idaho State Department of Agriculture Boise, Idaho 83701
Phone: (208) 332-8503 / Fax: (208) 334-2170 P.O. Box 790

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 20 October 3, 2018 — Vol. 18-10


http://www.agri.idaho.gov

IDAPA 07 — DIVISION OF BUILDING SAFETY
07.02.06 — RULES CONCERNING IDAHO STATE PLUMBING CODE
DOCKET NO. 07-0206-1702
NOTICE OF RULEMAKING — ADOPTION OF PENDING RULE

EFFECTIVE DATE: This rule has been adopted by the agency and is now pending review by the 2019 Idaho State
Legislature for final approval. The pending rule becomes final and effective at the conclusion of the legislative
session, unless the rule is approved or rejected in part by concurrent resolution in accordance with Section 67-5224
and 67-5291, Idaho Code. If the pending rule is approved or rejected in part by concurrent resolution, the rule
becomes final and effective upon adoption of the concurrent resolution or upon the date specified in the concurrent
resolution.

AUTHORITY: In compliance with Section 67-5224, Idaho Code, notice is hereby given that this agency has adopted
a pending rule. The action is authorized pursuant to Section 54-2606, Idaho Code.

DESCRIPTIVE SUMMARY: The following is a concise explanatory statement of the reasons for adopting the
pending rule and a statement of any change between the text of the proposed rule and the text of the pending rule with
an explanation of the reasons for the change:

There are no changes to the pending rule and it is being adopted as originally proposed. The complete text of the
proposed rule was published in the August 1, 2018 Idaho Administrative Bulletin, Vol. 18-8, pages 13-19.

FISCAL IMPACT: The following is a specific description, if applicable, of any negative fiscal impact on the state
general fund greater than ten thousand dollars ($10,000) during the fiscal year: N/A

ASSISTANCE ON TECHNICAL QUESTIONS: For assistance on technical questions concerning this pending
rule, contact John Nielsen, Plumbing Program Manager, at (208) 332-7112.

Dated this 30th day of August, 2018.

Ron Whitney, Deputy Administrator
Division of Building Safety

1090 E. Watertower St., Ste. 150

P. O. Box 83720

Meridian, ID 83642

Phone: (208) 332-7150

Fax: (877) 810-2840

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 21 October 3, 2018 — Vol. 18-10


https://adminrules.idaho.gov/bulletin/2018/08.pdf#page=13

IDAPA 07 — DIVISION OF BUILDING SAFETY
07.03.01 — RULES OF BUILDING SAFETY
DOCKET NO. 07-0301-1801
NOTICE OF RULEMAKING — PROPOSED RULE

AUTHORITY: In compliance with Section 67-5221(1), Idaho Code, notice is hereby given that this agency has
initiated proposed rulemaking procedures. The action is authorized pursuant to Sections 39-4107 and 39-4109, Idaho
Code.

PUBLIC HEARING SCHEDULE: Public hearing(s) concerning this rulemaking will be scheduled if requested in
writing by twenty-five (25) persons, a political subdivision, or an agency, not later than October 17, 2018.

The hearing site(s) will be accessible to persons with disabilities. Requests for accommodation must be made not
later than five (5) days prior to the hearing, to the agency address below.

DESCRIPTIVE SUMMARY: The following is a nontechnical explanation of the substance and purpose of the
proposed rulemaking:

Recent amendments to Sections 39-4109 and 39-4116, Idaho Code, remove part IV as it pertains to energy
conservation from the adopted version of the International Residential Code (IRC). This rulemaking will implement
those amendments by removing IDAPA 07.03.01.004.02.p. (Chapter 11 Energy Efficiency) from the adopted version
of the IRC and references to Chapter 11 from the adopted version of the International Energy Conservation Code
(IECC).

Table C404.5.1 of the adopted version of the IECC identifies maximum piping lengths for hot water piping from
a hot water source to the termination of the fixture supply pipe. The maximum lengths for public lavatory faucets are
unnecessarily short. The minimal energy savings that result from these short maximum piping lengths do not justify
the difficulty and cost of creating design and construction solutions. This rulemaking will increase the maximum
piping lengths for public lavatory faucets in table C404.5.1. The proposed maximum piping lengths take into
consideration energy savings while reducing cost and providing for a more efficient installation.

FEE SUMMARY: The following is a specific description of the fee or charge imposed or increased: N/A

FISCAL IMPACT: The following is a specific description, if applicable, of any negative fiscal impact on the state
general fund greater than ten thousand dollars ($10,000) during the fiscal year resulting from this rulemaking: N/A

NEGOTIATED RULEMAKING: Pursuant to Section 67-5220(1), Idaho Code, negotiated rulemaking was
conducted. The Notice of Intent to Promulgate Rules - Negotiated Rulemaking was published in the April 4, 2018
Idaho Administrative Bulletin, Vol. 18-4, pages 14-15.

INCORPORATION BY REFERENCE: Pursuant to Section 67-5229(2)(a), Idaho Code, the following is a brief
synopsis of why the materials cited are being incorporated by reference into this rule:

This rulemaking will implement recent amendments to Sections 39-4109 and 39-4116, Idaho Code, by removing
IDAPA 07.03.01.004.02.p. (Chapter 11 Energy Efficiency) from the adopted version of the IRC and references to
Chapter 11 from the adopted version of the IECC. This rulemaking will also increase the maximum piping lengths for
public lavatory faucets in table C404.5.1 of the adopted version of the IECC.

ASSISTANCE ON TECHNICAL QUESTIONS, SUBMISSION OF WRITTEN COMMENTS: For assistance

on technical questions concerning the proposed rule, contact Jeff Egan, Building Program Manager, at (208) 481-
1366.

Anyone may submit written comments regarding this proposed rulemaking. All written comments must be
directed to the undersigned and must be delivered on or before October 24, 2018.

Dated this 28th day of August, 2018.

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 22 October 3, 2018 — Vol. 18-10


https://adminrules.idaho.gov/bulletin/2018/04.pdf#page=14

DIVISION OF BUILDING SAFETY Docket No. 07-0301-1801
Rules of Building Safety Proposed Rulemaking

Ron Whitney, Deputy Administrator — Administration
Division of Building Safety

1090 E. Watertower St., Ste. 150

P. O. Box 83720

Meridian, ID 83642

Phone: (208) 332-7150

Fax: (877) 810-2840

THE FOLLOWING IS THE PROPOSED TEXT OF DOCKET NO. 07-0301-1801
(Only Those Sections With Amendments Are Shown.)

004. ADOPTION AND INCORPORATION BY REFERENCE.

Under the provisions of Section 39-4109, Idaho Code, the codes enumerated in this Section are hereby adopted and
incorporated by reference into IDAPA 07.03.01, “Rules of Building Safety,” Division of Building Safety. Pursuant to
Section 39-4109, Idaho Code, the effective date of any edition of the codes adopted in this Section, or any
amendments identified thereto, shall be January 1 of the succeeding year following legislative approval of the
rulemaking establishing the edition or amendment. Copies of these documents may be reviewed at the office of the
Division of Building Safety. The referenced codes may be obtained from International Code Council, 5360 Workman
Mill Road, Whittier, California 90601-2298 or the International Code Council at http://www.iccsafe.org.  (3-20-14)

01. International Building Code. 2015 Edition with the following amendments: (3-29-17)

a. Delete section 305.2.3 and replace with the following: Twelve (12) or fewer children in a dwelling
unit. A facility such as the above within a dwelling unit and having twelve (12) or fewer children receiving such day
care shall be classified as a Group R-3 occupancy or shall comply with the International Residential Code. (3-20-14)

b. Delete section 308.6.4 and replace with the following: Persons receiving care in a dwelling unit. A
facility such as the above within a dwelling unit and having twelve (12) or fewer children receiving day care or
having five (5) or fewer persons receiving custodial care shall be classified as a Group R-3 occupancy or shall comply

with the International Residential Code. (3-20-14)
c. Delete section 310.5 and replace with the following: Residential Group R-3. Residential Group R-3
occupancies where the occupants are primarily permanent in nature and not classified as Group R-1, R-2, R-4, E or I,
including: (3-29-17)
1. Buildings that do not contain more than two (2) dwelling units; (3-20-14)
il. Boarding houses (nontransient) with sixteen (16) or fewer occupants; (3-20-14)
1ii. Boarding houses (transient) with ten (10) or fewer occupants; (3-20-14)
iv. Care facilities that provide accommodations for five (5) or fewer persons receiving care; (3-20-14)
V. Congregate living facilities (nontransient) with sixteen (16) or fewer occupants; (3-20-14)
Vi. Congregate living facilities (transient) with ten (10) or fewer occupants; or (3-20-14)
Vil. Dwelling units providing day care for twelve (12) or fewer children. (3-20-14)
viil. Lodging houses with five (5) or fewer guest rooms. (3-29-17)
d. Delete section 310.5.1 and replace with the following: Care facilities within a dwelling. Care

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 23 October 3, 2018 — Vol. 18-10


http://www.iccsafe.org

DIVISION OF BUILDING SAFETY Docket No. 07-0301-1801
Rules of Building Safety Proposed Rulemaking

facilities for twelve (12) or fewer children receiving day care or for five (5) or fewer persons receiving care that are
within a single-family dwelling are permitted to comply with the International Residential Code. (3-20-14)

e. Delete the last paragraph of section 2107.2.1 Lap Splices, and replace with the following: In
regions of moment where the design tensile stresses in the reinforcement are greater than eighty percent (80%) of the
allowable steel tension stress, FS, the lap length of splices shall be increased not less than fifty percent (50%) of the
minimum required length, but need not be greater than 72 db. Other equivalent means of stress transfer to accomplish
the same fifty percent (50%) increase shall be permitted. Where epoxy coated bars are used, lap length shall be
increased by fifty percent (50%). (3-28-18)

f. Add footnote (f) in the header row of the table column labeled “Drinking Fountains” of Table
2902.1 Minimum Number of Required Plumbing Fixtures, and add footnote (f) under Table 2902.1 to state the
following: Drinking fountains are not required for an occupant load of thirty (30) or fewer. (3-29-17)

g. Delete footnote (e) contained under Table 2902.1 Minimum Number of Required Plumbing
Fixtures and replace with the following: For business occupancies, excluding restaurants, and mercantile occupancies
with an occupant load of thirty (30) or fewer, service sinks shall not be required. (3-29-17)

02. International Residential Code. 2012 Edition with the following amendments: (3-20-14)
a. Delete exception No. 1 contained under IRC section R101.2 - Scope. (3-20-14)

b. Delete exception No. 2 contained under IRC section R101.2 - Scope, and replace with the
following: Owner-occupied lodging houses with five (5) or fewer guestrooms shall be permitted to be constructed in
accordance with the International Residential Code for One- and Two-family Dwellings. (4-11-15)

c. Delete item No. 7 contained under the “Building” subsection of IRC section R105.2 - Work exempt
from permit, and replace with the following: Prefabricated swimming pools that are not greater than four (4) feet (one
thousand, two hundred nineteen (1219) mm) deep. (4-7-11)

d. Add the following item No. 11 at the end of the “Building” subsection of IRC section R105.2 -
Work exempt from permit: Flag poles. (3-20-14)

e. Delete IRC section R109.1.3 and replace with the following: Floodplain inspections. For
construction in areas prone to flooding as established by Table R301.2(1), upon placement of the lowest floor,
including basement, the building official is authorized to require submission of documentation of the elevation of the

lowest floor, including basement, required in section R322. (3-29-10)
f. IRC Table R302.1(1) Exterior Walls -- delete Table R302.1(1) and replace with the following:
TABLE R302.1(1)
EXTERIOR WALLS
MINIMUM FIRE
EXTERIOR WALL ELEMENT Ll LSk ':i.E;EgSISTANCE SEPARATION
DISTANCE
1 hour-tested in accordance with
Fire-resistance rated ASTM E 119 or UL263 with < 3 feet
Walls exposure from both sides
Not fire-resistance rated 0 hours > 3 feet
Fire-resistance rated 1 hour on the underside 2 2 feet to < 3 feet
Projections
Not fire-resistance rated 0 hours > 3 feet

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 24 October 3, 2018 — Vol. 18-10



DIVISION OF BUILDING SAFETY Docket No. 07-0301-1801

Rules of Building Safety Proposed Rulemaking
MINIMUM FIRE
EXTERIOR WALL ELEMENT RINMUN I:iEI'EESISTANCE SEPARATION
DISTANCE
Openings Not allowed N/A < 3 feet
in 25% maximum of wall area 0 hours > 3 feet to < 5 feet
Walls Unlimited 0 hours 5 feet
Comply with Section R302.4 < 3 feet
Penetrations All
None required > 3 feet
For SI: 1 foot =304.8 mm.
N/A =Not Applicable (4-11-15)
g. Delete the exception contained under IRC section R302.2 -- Townhouses, and replace with the
following two (2) exceptions: (3-25-16)

i When provided with an automatic fire sprinkler system per section R313.1, a common one (1)-hour
fire-resistance-rated wall assembly tested in accordance with ASTM E 119 or UL 263 is permltted for townhouses if
such walls do not contain plumbing or mechanical equipment, ducts, or vents in the cavity of the common wall. The
wall shall be rated for fire exposure from both sides, and shall extend to and be tight against exterior walls and the
underside of the roof sheathing. Penetrations of electrical outlet boxes shall be in accordance with Section R302.4.

(3-25-16)

ii. Two (2) one (1)-hour fire-resistance-rated wall assemblies (as specified in Section R302.1) or a
common two (2)-hour fire-resistance-rated wall assembly tested in accordance with ASTM E 119 or UL 263 are
permitted for townhouses. If two (2) one (1)-hour fire-resistance-rated walls are used, plumbing and electrical
installations within the wall cavity shall conform to fire-resistance penetration requirements in accordance with
section R302.4 through R302.4.2 for each of the two (2) one (1)-hour rated walls penetrated. The two (2)-hour fire-
resistance-rated common wall shall not contain plumbing or mechanical equipment, ducts or vents within its wall
cavity. The wall shall be rated for fire exposure from both sides, and shall extend to and be tight against the exterior
walls and the underside of the roof sheathing. Penetrations of electrical outlet boxes shall be in accordance with
Section R302.4. (3-25-16)

h. Delete IRC section R303.4 and replace with the following: R303.4 Mechanical Ventilation.
Dwelling units shall be provided with whole-house mechanical ventilation in accordance with Section M1507.3

Exception: Where the air infiltration rate of a dwelling unit is equal to 5 air changes per hour or greater when
tested with a blower door at a pressure of 0.2 inch w.c. (50 pa) in accordance with Section N1102.4.1.2.  (4-11-15)

i. Delete the exception contained under IRC section R313.1 -- Townhouse automatic fire sprinkler
systems, and replace with the following: Exception: Automatic residential fire sprinkler systems shall not be required
in townhouses where either two (2) one (1)-hour fire-resistance-rated walls or a common two (2)-hour fire-resistance
rated wall, as specified in exception 2 of section R302.2 is installed between dwelling units or when additions or
alterations are made to existing townhouses that do not have an automatic residential fire sprinkler system installed.

(3-25-16)
j- Delete IRC section R313.2. (3-29-10)
k. Add the following to IRC section R315.3 - Where required in existing dwellings: Exceptions: 1.

Work involving the exterior surfaces of dwellings, such as, but not limited to, replacement of roofing or siding, or the
addition or replacement of windows or doors, or the addition of a porch or deck or electrical permits, are exempt from
the requirements of this section; and 2. Installation, alteration or repairs of noncombustion plumbing or mechanical
systems are exempt from the requirements of this section. (3-20-14)

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 25 October 3, 2018 — Vol. 18-10



DIVISION OF BUILDING SAFETY Docket No. 07-0301-1801

Rules of Building Safety Proposed Rulemaking
L Delete IRC section R322.1.10. (3-29-10)
m. Delete IRC section R322.2.2 subparagraph 2.2, and replace with the following: The total net area of

all openings shall be at least one (1) square inch (645 mm2) for each square foot (0.093 m2) of enclosed area, or the
opening shall be designed and the construction documents shall include a statement that the design and installation of
the openings will provide for equalization of hydrostatic flood forces on exterior walls by allowing the automatic

entry and exit of floodwaters. (3-20-14)
n. Delete IRC section R501.3 and its exceptions. (3-20-14)
0. Delete IRC section R602.10 and replace with the following: Wall bracing. Buildings shall be

braced in accordance with this section or, when applicable section R602.12, or the most current edition of APA
System Report SR-102 as an alternate method. Where a building, or portion thereof, does not comply with one (1) or
more of the bracing requirements in this section, those portions shall be designated and constructed in accordance
with section R301.1. (3-20-14)

Add an Appendix R, titled Tiny Homes to include the following provisions: (3-28-18)

Section AR101 Scope. This appendix shall be applicable to tiny houses used as single dwelling
units. Tiny houses shall comply with this code except as otherwise stated in this appendix. (3-28-18)

ii. Section AR102 Definitions. The following words and terms shall, for the purposes of this appendix,
have the meanings shown herein. Refer to Chapter 2 of this code for general definitions. (3-28-18)

(1) Tiny House. A dwelling that is four hundred (400) square feet (thirty-seven (37) m) or less in floor
area excluding lofts. (3-28-18)

(2) Escape and Rescue Roof Access Window. A skylight or roof window designed and installed to

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 26 October 3, 2018 — Vol. 18-10



DIVISION OF BUILDING SAFETY Docket No. 07-0301-1801
Rules of Building Safety Proposed Rulemaking

satisfy the emergency escape and rescue opening requirements in Section R310. (3-28-18)
3) Landing Platform. A landing provided as the top step of a stairway accessing a loft. (3-28-18)

4 Loft. A floor level located more than thirty (30) inches (762 mm) above the main floor and open to
it on at least one (1) side with a ceiling height of less than six (6) feet eight (8) inches (2032 mm), used as a living or
sleeping space. (3-28-18)

(iii) Section AR103 Minimum Ceiling Height. Habitable space and hallways in tiny houses shall have a
ceiling height of not less than six (6) feet eight (8) inches (2032 mm). Bathrooms, toilet rooms, and kitchens shall
have a ceiling height of not less than six (6) feet four (4) inches (1930 mm). Obstructions shall not extend below these
minimum ceiling heights including beams, girders, ducts, lighting and other obstructions. Exception: Ceiling heights

in lofts are permitted to be less than six (6) feet eight (8) inches (2032 mm) (3-28-18)
iv. Section AR104 Lofts. (3-28-18)
(1) AR104.1 Minimum loft area and dimensions. Lofts used as a sleeping or living space shall meet the
minimum area and dimension requirements of Sections AR104.1.1 through AR104.1.3. (3-28-18)
(a) AR104.1.1 Minimum area. Lofts shall have a floor area of not less than thirty-five (35) square feet
(3.25 m). (3-28-18)
(b) AR104.1.2 Minimum dimensions. Lofts shall be not less than five (5) feet (1524 mm) in any
horizontal dimension. (3-28-18)
(c) AR104.1.3 Height effect on loft area. Portions of a loft with a sloping ceiling measuring less than

three (3) feet (914 mm) from the finished floor to the finished ceiling shall not be considered as contributing to the
minimum required area for the loft. Exception: Under gable roofs with a minimum slope of 6:12, portions of a loft
with a sloping ceiling measuring less than 16 inches (406 mm) from the finished floor to the finished ceiling shall not
be considered as contributing to the minimum required area for the loft. (3-28-18)

2) AR104.2 Loft Access. The access to and primary egress from lofts shall be any type described in

Sections AR104.3 through AR104.6. (3-28-18)
3) AR104.3. Stairways. Stairways accessing lofts shall comply with this code or with Sections
AR104.3.1 through AR104.3.5. (3-28-18)

(a) AR104.3.1 Width. Stairways accessing a loft shall not be less than seventeen (17) inches (432 mm)
in clear width at or above the handrail. The minimum width below the handrail shall be not less than twenty (20)
inches (508 mm). (3-28-18)

(b) AR104.3.2 Headroom. The headroom in stairways accessing a loft shall be not less than six (6) feet
two (2) inches (1880 mm), as measured vertically, from a sloped line connecting the tread or landing platform nosings
in the middle of their width. Exception: The headroom for a landing platform, where stairways access lofts, shall be

not less than four (4) feet six (6) inches (1372 mm). (3-28-18)
() AR104.3.3 Treads and Risers. Risers for stairs accessing a loft shall be not less than seven (7)
inches (178 mm) and not more than twelve (12) inches (305 mm) in height. Tread depth and riser height shall be
calculated in accordance with one of the following formulas: (3-28-18)
(1) The tread depth shall be twenty (20) inches (508 mm) minus 4/3 of the riser height, or  (3-28-18)
(i1) The riser height shall be fifteen (15) inches (381 mm) minus 3/4 of the tread depth. (3-28-18)

(d) AR104.3.4 Landing Platforms. The top tread and riser of stairways accessing lofts shall be
constructed as a landing platform where the loft ceiling height is less than six (6) feet two (2) inches (1880 mm)
where the stairway meets the loft. The landing platform shall be eighteen (18) inches to twenty-two (22) inches (457

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 27 October 3, 2018 — Vol. 18-10



DIVISION OF BUILDING SAFETY Docket No. 07-0301-1801
Rules of Building Safety Proposed Rulemaking

to 559 mm) in depth measured from the nosing of the landing platform to the edge of the loft, and sixteen (16) to
eighteen (18) inches (406 to 457 mm) in height measured from the landing platform to the loft floor. (3-28-18)

(e) AR104.3.5 Stairway Handrails. Handrails shall comply with Section R311.7.8. (3-28-18)

® AR104.3.6 Stairway Guards. Guards at open sides of stairways shall comply with Section R312.1.
(3-28-18)

4) AR104.4 Ladders. Ladders accessing lofts shall comply with Sections AR104.4.1 and AR104.4.2.
(3-28-18)

(a) AR104.4.1 Ladder Size and Capacity. Ladders accessing lofts shall have a rung width of not less
than twelve (12) inches (305 mm) and ten (10) inches (254 mm) to fourteen (14) inches (356 mm) spacing between
rungs. Ladders shall be capable of supporting a two hundred (200) pound (75 kg) load on any rung. Rung spacing

shall be uniform within 3/8-inch (9.5 mm). (3-28-18)
(b) AR104.4.2 Ladder Incline. Ladders shall be installed at seventy (70) to eighty (80) degrees from
horizontal. (3-28-18)
&) AR104.5 Alternating Tread Devices. Alternating tread devices accessing lofts, and handrails of

alternating tread devices shall comply with sections 1011.14.1 and 1011.14.2 of the International Building Code,
excluding the exception. The clear width at and below the handrails shall be not less than twenty (20) inches (508
mm). (3-28-18)

(6) AR104.6. Ships Ladders. Ships ladders accessing lofts, and treads and handrails of ships ladders
shall comply with sections 1011.15.1 and 1011.15.2 of the International Building Code. The clear width at and below
handrails shall be not less than twenty (20) inches (508 mm). (3-28-18)

7 AR104.7 Loft Guards. Loft guards shall be located along the open side of lofts. Loft guards shall
not be less than thirty-six (36) inches (914 mm) in height or one (1)-half of the clear height to the ceiling, whichever
is less. (3-28-18)

V. SECTION ARI105. Emergency Escape and Rescue Openings. Tiny houses shall meet the
requirements of Section R310 for emergency escape and rescue openings. Exception: Escape and rescue roof access
windows in lofts used as sleeping rooms shall be deemed to meet three (3) requirements of Section R310 where
installed such that the bottom of the opening is not more than forty-four (44) inches (1118 mm) above the loft floor,
provided the escape and rescue roof access window complies with the minimum opening area requirements of

Section R310. (3-28-18)
03. International Existing Building Code. 2015 Edition. (3-29-17)

04. International Energy Conservation Code. 2015 Edition with the following amendments:
(3-29-17)
a. Delete the Residential Provisions of the 2015 International Energy Conservation Code (IECC) set

forth in chapters 1 [RE] through 6 [RE], including Appendix RA (pages R-1 through R-57), and replace with the
Residential Provisions of the 2012 IECC set forth therein in chapters 1 [RE] through 5 [RE] (pages R-1 through R-
47) and as such provisions may be further amended herein these rules. (3-29-17)

b. Add the following as new subsection C101.5.3: Industrial, electronic, and manufacturing
equipment. Buildings or portions thereof that are heated or cooled exclusively to maintain the required operating
temperature of industrial, electronic, or manufacturing equipment shall be exempt from the provisions of this code.
Such buildings or portions thereof shall be separated from connected conditioned space by building thermal envelope
assemblies complying with this code. (3-25-16)

c. Add the following exception No. (10) under section C403.3 Economizers (Prescriptive): Unusual
outdoor air contaminate conditions — Systems where special outside air filtration and treatment for the reduction and

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 28 October 3, 2018 — Vol. 18-10



DIVISION OF BUILDING SAFETY Docket No. 07-0301-1801

Rules of Building Safety Proposed Rulemaking
treatment of unusual outdoor contaminants, makes an air economizer infeasible. (3-29-17)
d. Delete Table C404.5.1 and replace with the following:
TABLE C404.5.1
PIPING VOLUME AND MAXIMUM PIPING LENGTHS
NOMINAL VOLUME MAXIMUM PIPING LENGTH (feet)
PIPE SIZE (liguid ounces -
(inches) er foot length Public lavatory faucets Other fixtures.
and appliances
1/4 0.33 31 50
5/16 0.5 N/A - non-standard size 50
3/8 0.75 17 50
1/2 1.5 10 43
5/8 2 7 32
3/4 3 5 21
718 4 N/A - non-standard size 16
1 5 3 13
11/4 8 2 8
11/2 " 1 6
2 or larger 18 1 4
For SI: 1 inch =25.4 mm: 1 foot = 304.8 mm; 1 liquid ounce = 0.030 L: 1 gallon = 128 ounces. ( )

de. Delete the values contained in Table R402.1.1 (Fable NHH+62+-+) for climate zone “5 and Marine 4”
and climate zone “6” and replace with the following:

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 29 October 3, 2018 — Vol. 18-10



DIVISION OF BUILDING SAFETY

Rules of Building Safety

Docket No. 07-0301-1801
Proposed Rulemaking

TABLE R402.1.1
INSULATION AND FENESTRATION REQUIREMENTS BY COMPONENT

Glazed s Mass Basement Crawlspace
Climate | Fenestration | Skylight - Ceiling | Frame Floor Slab P
Zone U- Factor U-factor enestiatoy R-Value Wall weell R-Value el R-Value .1l
SHGC R-Value R-Value R-Value
R-Value
5 and 20 or
g9
Marine 4 0.35 0.60 NR 38 1345 13/17 30 10/13 10, 2 ft 10/13
20 or
6 0.35 0.60 NR 49 1345 15/19 309 15/19 10, 4 ft 10/13
32014 )
ef. Add the following footnote to the title of Table R402.1.1 - Insulation and Fenestration

Requirements by Component: * For residential log home building thermal envelope construction requirements see
section R402.6.

(3-25-16)

fe. Delete the values contained in Table R402.1.3 Fable NHHH2-4-3) for climate zone “5 and Marine 4”
and climate zone “6” and replace with the following:
TABLE R402.1.3
EQUIVALENT U-FACTORS
Climate | Fenestration | Skylight | Ceiling LG AL Mass Wall | Floor SsSIERt | niSpace
Zone U-factor U-factor | R-Value Wall R-Value | R-Value Wall Wall
R-Value R-Value R-Value
5and
: 0.35 0.60 0.030 0.057 0.082 0.033 0.059 0.065
Marine 4
6 0.35 0.60 0.026 0.057 0.060 0.033 0.050 0.065
(B3-20-+4)( )
gh. Delete Table R402.2.6 (Fabte NH1022-6) and replace with the following:

TABLE R402.2.6

STEEL-FRAME CEILING, WALL AND FLOOR INSULATION

(R-VALUE)

Wood Frame
R-value Requirement

Cold-formed Steel Equivalent R-value®

Steel Truss Ceilings®

R-30 R-38 or R-30 + 30or R-26 + 5
R-38 R-49 or R-38 +3
R-49 R-38 +5

a. Cavity insulation R-value is listed first, followed by continuous insulation R-value.
b. Insulation exceeding the height of the framing shall cover the framing.

Idaho Administrative Bulletin

Page 30

October 3, 2018 — Vol. 18-10



DIVISION OF BUILDING SAFETY Docket No. 07-0301-1801

Rules of Building Safety Proposed Rulemaking
TABLE R402.2.6
STEEL-FRAME CEILING, WALL AND FLOOR INSULATION
(R-VALUE)

Wood Frame

. Cold-formed Steel Equivalent R-value?
R-value Requirement

Steel Joist Ceilings®

R-30 R-38in 2 x4 or 2 x 6 or 2 x 8 R-49 in any framing
R-38 R-49in2x4o0r2x6o0r2x8o0r2x10
Steel-Framed Wall
R-13 R-13+50rR-15+4 0orR-21+3 0or R-0 + 10
R-19 R-13+90rR-19+80rR-25+7
R-21 R-13+100orR-19 + 9 or R-25 + 8
Steel Joist Floor
R-19in2x6
R-13 R-19+6in2x80r2x10
R-19 R-19+6in2x6

R-19+12in2x8o0r2x10

a. Cavity insulation R-value is listed first, followed by continuous insulation R-value.
b. Insulation exceeding the height of the framing shall cover the framing.

3-25-16)(__)

hi. Delete section R402.4.1 N+#62-4-4) and replace with the following: Building thermal envelope.
The building thermal envelope shall comply with sections R402.1.1 and either section R402.4.1.2 or R402.4.1.3. The
sealing methods between dissimilar materials shall allow for differential expansion and contraction. {3-25-46}( )

#. Delete section R402.4.1.1 (NHH24+4) and replace with the following: Installation. The
components of the building thermal envelope as listed in Table R402.4.1.1 shall be installed in accordance with the
manufacturer’s instructions and the criteria listed in Table R402.4.1.1, as applicable to the method of construction.

32516 )

k. Delete the criteria requirement for the “Fireplace” component of Table R402.4.1.1 {(Fable
- Air Barrier and Insulation Installation, and replace with the following: An air barrier shall be installed

NLHO241 1)
on fireplace walls. B20-4+H( )

%l Delete section R402.4.1.2 (NHH2-4-1-2) and replace with the following: Testing option, Building
envelope t1ghtness and insulation installation shall be considered acceptable when tested air leakage is less than seven
(7) air changes per hour (ACH) when tested with a blower door at a pressure of 33.5 psf (50 Pa). Testing shall occur
after rough in and after installation of penetrations of the building envelope, including penetrations for utilities,

plumbing, electrical, ventilation and combustion appliances. During testing: B-246)( )
i. Exterior windows and doors, fireplace and stove doors shall be closed, but not sealed;  (3-20-14)
1i. Dampers shall be closed, but not sealed, including exhaust, intake, makeup air, backdraft and flue
dampers; (3-20-14)
iil. Interior doors shall be open; (3-20-14)

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 31 October 3, 2018 — Vol. 18-10



DIVISION OF BUILDING SAFETY Docket No. 07-0301-1801

Rules of Building Safety Proposed Rulemaking
iv. Exterior openings for continuous ventilation systems and heat recovery ventilators shall be closed
and sealed; (3-20-14)
V. Heating and cooling system(s) shall be turned off; (3-20-14)
vi. HVAC ducts shall not be sealed; and (3-20-14)
Vii. Supply and return registers shall not be sealed. (3-20-14)

fm. Add the following as section R402.4.1.3 (NH#H2443): Visual inspection option, Building
envelope tightness and insulation installation shall be considered acceptable when the items listed in Table
R402.4.1.1, applicable to the method of construction, are field verified. Where required by code official an approved
party independent from the installer of the insulation shall inspect the air barrier and insulation. B3-25-46)( )

#N0. Add the following section: R402.6 {N##02-6) Residential Log Home Thermal Envelope.
Residential log home construction shall comply with sections R401 (General), R402.4 (Air Leakage), R402.5
(Maximum Fenestration U-Factor and SHGC), R403.1 (Controls), R403.2.2 (Sealing), R403.2.3 (Building Cavities),
sections R403.3 through R403.9 (referred to as the mandatory provisions), Section R404 (Electrical Power and

Lighting Systems), and either 1., ii., or iii. as follows: B-246)(_ )
1. Sections R402.2 through R402.3, R403.2.1, R404.1 and Table R402.6; (3-25-16)
ii. Section R405 Simulated Performance Alternative (Performance); or (3-25-16)
iil. REScheck (U.S. Department of Energy Building Codes Program). (4-7-11)

#0. Add Table R402.6 {Fable-N+02-6) Log Home Prescriptive Thermal Envelope Requirements By
Component to be used only in accordance with item i. of section R402.6 above to appear as follows:

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 32 October 3, 2018 — Vol. 18-10



DIVISION OF BUILDING SAFETY Docket No. 07-0301-1801
Rules of Building Safety Proposed Rulemaking

TABLE R402.6
LOG HOME PRESCRIPTIVE THERMAL ENVELOPE REQUIREMENTS BY COMPONENT

For Sl: 1 foot = 304.8 mm.

Min. Slab | Crawl
Climate Fenestration | Skylight F Glazed_ Ceiling Average Floor Basement R-value | Space
a enestration Log Wall
Zone U-factor U-factor R-value . R-value d & Wall
SHGC Size In R-value b d
Depth® | R-value
Inches
5, 6 - High
efficiency 0.32 0.60 NR 49 5 30 15119 | 10,4ft. | 10/13
equipment
path®
5 0.32 0.60 NR 49 8 30 10/13 10,2 ft. | 10/13
6 0.30 0.60 NR 49 8 30 15/19 10,4 ft. | 10/13

a. The fenestration U-factor column excludes skylights. The SHGC column applies to all glazed fenestration.
b. R-5 shall be added to the required slab edge R-values for heated slabs.

C. 90% AFUE natural gas or propane, 84% AFUE oil, or 15 SEER heat pump heating equipment (zonal electric resis-
tance heating equipment such as electric base board electric resistance heating equipment as the sole source for heating
is considered compliant with the high efficiency equipment path).

d. “15/19” means R-15 continuous insulated sheathing on the interior or exterior of the home or R-19 cavity insulation at
the interior of the basement wall. “15/19” shall be permitted to be met with R-13 cavity insulation on the interior of the base-
ment wall plus R-5 continuous insulated sheathing on the interior or exterior of the home. “10/13” means R-10 continuous

insulated sheathing on the interior or exterior of the home or R-13 cavity insulation at the interior of the basement wall.

3246 )

6p. Delete section R404.1 (A404+) and replace with the following: Lighting equipment (Mandatory).
A minimum of fifty percent (50%) of the lamps in permanently installed lighting fixtures shall be high-efficacy lamps
or a minimum of fifty percent (50%) of the permanently installed lighting fixtures shall contain only high efficacy
lamps.

05. References to Other Codes. Where any provisions of the codes that are adopted in this Section
make reference to other construction and safety-related model codes or standards which have not been adopted by the
involved authority having jurisdiction, to the extent possible, such reference should be construed as pertaining to the
equivalent code or standard that has been duly adopted by such jurisdiction. (3-29-10)

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 33 October 3, 2018 — Vol. 18-10




IDAPA 07 — DIVISION OF BUILDING SAFETY
07.05.01 — RULES OF THE PUBLIC WORKS CONTRACTORS LICENSE BOARD
DOCKET NO. 07-0501-1801
NOTICE OF RULEMAKING — ADOPTION OF PENDING RULE

EFFECTIVE DATE: This rule has been adopted by the agency and is now pending review by the 2019 Idaho State
Legislature for final approval. The pending rule becomes final and effective at the conclusion of the legislative
session, unless the rule is approved or rejected in part by concurrent resolution in accordance with Sections 67-5224
and 67-5291, Idaho Code. If the pending rule is approved or rejected in part by concurrent resolution, the rule
becomes final and effective upon adoption of the concurrent resolution or upon the date specified in the concurrent
resolution.

AUTHORITY: In compliance with Section 67-5224, Idaho Code, notice is hereby given that this agency has adopted
a pending rule. The action is authorized pursuant to Sections 54-1907 and 54-1910, Idaho Code.

DESCRIPTIVE SUMMARY: The following is a concise explanatory statement of the reasons for adopting the
pending rule and a statement of any change between the text of the proposed rule and the text of the pending rule with
an explanation of the reasons for the change:

There are no changes to the pending rule and it is being adopted as originally proposed. The complete text of the
proposed rule was published in the August 1, 2018 Idaho Administrative Bulletin, Vol. 18-8, pages 20-22.

FISCAL IMPACT: The following is a specific description, if applicable, of any negative fiscal impact on the state
general fund greater than ten thousand dollars ($10,000) during the fiscal year: N/A

ASSISTANCE ON TECHNICAL QUESTIONS: For assistance on technical questions concerning this pending
rule, contact Ron Whitney, Deputy Administrator, at (208) 332-7150.

Dated this 30th day of August, 2018.

Ron Whitney, Deputy Administrator
Division of Building Safety

1090 E. Watertower St., Ste. 150

P. O. Box 83720

Meridian, ID 83642

Phone: (208) 332-7150

Fax: (877) 810-2840

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 34 October 3, 2018 — Vol. 18-10


https://adminrules.idaho.gov/bulletin/2018/08.pdf#page=20

IDAPA 07 — DIVISION OF BUILDING SAFETY

07.07.01 — RULES GOVERNING INSTALLATION OF HEATING, VENTILATION,
AND AIR CONDITIONING SYSTEMS, DIVISION OF BUILDING SAFETY

DOCKET NO. 07-0701-1703
NOTICE OF RULEMAKING — ADOPTION OF PENDING RULE

EFFECTIVE DATE: This rule has been adopted by the agency and is now pending review by the 2019 Idaho State
Legislature for final approval. The pending rule becomes final and effective at the conclusion of the legislative
session, unless the rule is approved or rejected in part by concurrent resolution in accordance with Sections 67-5224
and 67-5291, Idaho Code. If the pending rule is approved or rejected in part by concurrent resolution, the rule
becomes final and effective upon adoption of the concurrent resolution or upon the date specified in the concurrent
resolution.

AUTHORITY: In compliance with Section 67-5224, Idaho Code, notice is hereby given that this agency has adopted
a pending rule. The action is authorized pursuant to Section 54-5005, Idaho Code.

DESCRIPTIVE SUMMARY: The following is a concise explanatory statement of the reasons for adopting the
pending rule and a statement of any change between the text of the proposed rule and the text of the pending rule with
an explanation of the reasons for the change:

There are no changes to the pending rule and it is being adopted as originally proposed. The complete text of the
proposed rule was published in the August 1, 2018 Idaho Administrative Bulletin, Vol. 18-8, pages 23-24.

FISCAL IMPACT: The following is a specific description, if applicable, of any negative fiscal impact on the state
general fund greater than ten thousand dollars ($10,000) during the fiscal year: N/A

ASSISTANCE ON TECHNICAL QUESTIONS: For assistance on technical questions concerning this pending
rule, contact John Nielsen, HVAC Program Manager, at (208) 332-7112.

Dated this 30th day of August, 2018.

Ron Whitney, Deputy Administrator
Division of Building Safety

1090 E. Watertower St., Ste. 150

P. O. Box 83720

Meridian, ID 83642

Phone: (208) 332-7150

Fax: (877) 810-2840

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 35 October 3, 2018 — Vol. 18-10


https://adminrules.idaho.gov/bulletin/2018/08.pdf#page=23

IDAPA 08 — STATE BOARD OF EDUCATION
08.01.04 — RESIDENCY
DOCKET NO. 08-0104-1801
NOTICE OF RULEMAKING — PROPOSED RULE

AUTHORITY: In compliance with Section 67-5221(1), Idaho Code, notice is hereby given that this agency has
initiated proposed rulemaking procedures. The action is authorized pursuant to Article IX, Section 2 of the Idaho
Constitution and under Section 33-3717B, Idaho Code.

PUBLIC HEARING SCHEDULE: Public hearing(s) concerning this rulemaking will be scheduled if requested in
writing by twenty-five (25) persons, a political subdivision, or an agency, not later than October 17, 2018.

The hearing site(s) will be accessible to persons with disabilities. Requests for accommodation must be made not
later than five (5) days prior to the hearing, to the agency address below.

DESCRIPTIVE SUMMARY: The following is a nontechnical explanation of the substance and purpose of the
proposed rulemaking:

The proposed amendments make technical corrections to the existing residency requirement used for
determining eligibility for “in-state” tuition. These amendments include: removing the reference to Eastern Idaho
Technical College; simplifying the definition of “support” for determining if a student is a dependent of a parent or
guardian; and removing a reference to hourly equivalent in reference to full-time employment.

FEE SUMMARY: The following is a specific description of the fee or charge imposed or increased: N/A

FISCAL IMPACT: The following is a specific description, if applicable, of any negative fiscal impact on the state
general fund greater than ten thousand dollars ($10,000) during the fiscal year resulting from this rulemaking: None.

NEGOTIATED RULEMAKING: Pursuant to Section 67-5220(1), Idaho Code, negotiated rulemaking was
conducted. The Notice of Intent to Promulgate Rules — Negotiated Rulemaking was published in the July 4, 2018,
Idaho Administrative Bulletin, Vol. 18-7, page 48.

INCORPORATION BY REFERENCE: Pursuant to Section 67-5229(2)(a), Idaho Code, the following is a brief
synopsis of why the materials cited are being incorporated by reference into this rule: N/A

ASSISTANCE ON TECHNICAL QUESTIONS, SUBMISSION OF WRITTEN COMMENTS: For assistance
on technical questions concerning the proposed rule, contact Tracie Bent at (208) 332-1582 or
tracie.bent@osbe.idaho.gov.

Anyone may submit written comments regarding this proposed rulemaking. All written comments must be
directed to the undersigned and must be delivered on or before October 24, 2018.

Dated this 31st day of August, 2018.

Tracie Bent

Chief Planning and Policy Officer
State Board of Education

650 W. State Street

P.O. Box 83720

Boise, Idaho 83720-0037

Phone: (208) 332-1582

Fax: (208) 334-2632

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 36 October 3, 2018 — Vol. 18-10


mailto:tracie.bent@osbe.idaho.gov
https://adminrules.idaho.gov/bulletin/2018/07.pdf#page=48

STATE BOARD OF EDUCATION Docket No. 08-0104-1801
Residency Proposed Rulemaking

THE FOLLOWING IS THE PROPOSED TEXT OF DOCKET NO. 08-0104-1801
(Only Those Sections With Amendments Are Shown.)

001. TITLE AND SCOPE.
01. Title. The title of this chapter is Residency. (3-29-17)
02. Scope. This chapter governs residency classification for tuition purposes for the four-year

institutions axnd—FEastern-tdaho—Technical—Cottege under the governance of the State Board of Education and the
Regents of the University of Idaho pursuant to Section 33-3717B, Idaho Code. B3-29-47)( )

(BREAK IN CONTINUITY OF SECTIONS)

010. DEFINITIONS.

01. Accredited Secondary School. An Idaho secondary school accredited by a body recognized by the
State Board of Education. (3-29-17)

02. Armed Forces. The United States Army, Navy, Air Force, Marine Corps, Coast Guard, and their
reserve forces. It does not include the National Guard or any other reserve force. (3-29-17)

03. Continuously Resided. Physical presence in the state for twelve (12) consecutive months.
Absence from the state for normal vacations, family travel, work assignments, short-term military training, and
similar occasions during the twelve-month (12) qualifying period, in and of itself, will not be regarded as negating the

continuous residence of the individual. (3-29-17)
04. Full-time Employment. Employment consisting on average of at least thirty (30) hours of service
per week, or one hundred twenty (120) hours of service per month. (3-29-17)

0s. Full-time Student. A student taking the number of credits set by the State Board of Education to
constitute a full course load. (3-29-17)

06. Support. “Support” means financial support given to the student during the twelve (12) months
preceding the opening date of the term for which resident status is requested, but shall not include educational
scholarships or grants provided to the student to attend a postsecondary educational institution. Any student who
receives less than fifty percent (50%) support may demonstrate this by showing that the student is not claimed as a

dependent by a parent or guardlan for income tax pumosese%wmmﬁdm&y@

011. - 099. (RESERVED)

100. RESIDENT CLASSIFICATION BY ALL INSTITUTIONS.
Any student classified as a resident student for purposes of tuition by one (1) of the institutions erEeasternidaho

Feehnieal-Cotlege shall be considered a resident by all other institutions. B-29-47)( )

(BREAK IN CONTINUITY OF SECTIONS)

102. FACTORS FOR DETERMINING DOMICILE.

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 37 October 3, 2018 — Vol. 18-10



STATE BOARD OF EDUCATION Docket No. 08-0104-1801

Residency Proposed Rulemaking
The following, if supported by documentation, support a claim of domicile in Idaho. (3-29-17)
01. Tax Returns and Employment. Both of the following, if done for at least twelve (12) months
before the term in which the student proposes to enroll, proves the establishment and maintenance of domicile in
Idaho for purposes other than educational: (3-29-17)
a. Filing of Idaho state income tax returns covering a period of at least twelve (12) months before the
term in which the student proposes to enroll as a resident student; and (3-29-17)
b. Full-time employment o#the-honrbeguivatent in Idaho. 32947 )
02. Multiple Factors. Five (5) of the following factors, if done for at least twelve (12) months before
the term in which the student proposes to enroll, proves the establishment and maintenance of domicile in Idaho for
purposes other than educational: (3-29-17)
a. Ownership or leasing of a residence in Idaho. (3-29-17)
b. Registration and payment of Idaho taxes or fees, other than sales erineome tax, including
registration and payment of Idaho taxes or fees on a motor vehicle, mobile home, travel trailer, or other item of
personal property for which state registration and the payment of state tax or fee is required. B-29-17( )
c. Registration to vote for state elected officials in Idaho at a general election. (1-1-94)
d. Holding of an Idaho driver's license or state-issued identification card. (3-29-17)
e. Evidence of the abandonment of a previous domicile. (1-1-94)
f. The establishment of accounts with financial institutions in Idaho. (3-29-17)
g. Other similar factors indicating intent to be domiciled in Idaho and the maintenance of such

domicile. Factors may include, but are not limited to, enrollment of dependent children in Idaho elementary or
secondary schools, establishment of acceptance of an offer of permanent employment for self in Idaho, documented
need to care for a relative in Idaho, utility statements, or employment documentation. Multiple factors under this
category may be used. (3-29-17)

04. Idaho Elementary and Secondary Students. If a student meets the requirements set forth under
Idaho Code, Section 33-3717B(1)(c), that student shall not be required to meet the twelve (12) month requirement for
establishing domicile. (3-29-17)

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 38 October 3, 2018 — Vol. 18-10



IDAPA 08 — STATE BOARD OF EDUCATION
08.01.13 — RULES GOVERNING THE OPPORTUNITY SCHOLARSHIP PROGRAM
DOCKET NO. 08-0113-1802
NOTICE OF RULEMAKING — PROPOSED RULE

AUTHORITY: In compliance with Section 67-5221(1), Idaho Code, notice is hereby given that this agency has
initiated proposed rulemaking procedures. The action is authorized pursuant to Article IX, Section 2, Idaho
Constitution and under Sections 33-105, 33-107, and 33-4303, Idaho Code.

PUBLIC HEARING SCHEDULE: Public hearing(s) concerning this rulemaking will be scheduled if requested in
writing by twenty-five (25) persons, a political subdivision, or an agency, not later than October 17, 2018.

The hearing site(s) will be accessible to persons with disabilities. Requests for accommodation must be made not
later than five (5) days prior to the hearing, to the agency address below.

DESCRIPTIVE SUMMARY: The following is a nontechnical explanation of the substance and purpose of the
proposed rulemaking:

The proposed rule would make amendments to the student eligibility and application requirements to allow for a
portion of the Opportunity Scholarship awards to be used for individuals who have earned 24 or more postsecondary
credits. Proposed amendments would include: lowering the minimum GPA to 2.7; allowing students who have earned
24 or more credits to apply up to three-weeks prior to the start of the term; requiring these students to have “stopped
out” for 24 or more months; allowing students to attend part-time; pro-rate the amount of the award based on the
number of credits attempted down to a minimum of six (6) credits; requiring institutions to discuss opportunities for
receiving credits through prior learning assessments; and requiring students to show progress on their educational
plan to maintain scholarship eligibility.

FEE SUMMARY: The following is a specific description of the fee or charge imposed or increased: N/A

FISCAL IMPACT: The following is a specific description, if applicable, of any negative fiscal impact on the state
general fund greater than ten thousand dollars ($10,000) during the fiscal year resulting from this rulemaking: None.

NEGOTIATED RULEMAKING: Pursuant to Section 67-5220(1), Idaho Code, negotiated rulemaking was
conducted. The Notice of Intent to Promulgate Rules — Negotiated Rulemaking was published in the July 4, 2018,
Idaho Administrative Bulletin, Vol. 18-7, page 49.

INCORPORATION BY REFERENCE: Pursuant to Section 67-5229(2)(a), Idaho Code, the following is a brief
synopsis of why the materials cited are being incorporated by reference into this rule: N/A

ASSISTANCE ON TECHNICAL QUESTIONS, SUBMISSION OF WRITTEN COMMENTS: For assistance
on technical questions concerning the proposed rule, contact Tracie Bent at (208) 332-1582 or
tracie.bent@osbe.idaho.gov.

Anyone may submit written comments regarding this proposed rulemaking. All written comments must be
directed to the undersigned and must be delivered on or before October 24, 2018.

Dated this 31st day of August, 2018.

Tracie Bent, Chief Planning and Policy Officer
State Board of Education

650 W. State Street

P.O. Box 83720

Boise, Idaho 83720-0037

Phone: (208) 332-1582

Fax: (208) 334-2632

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 39 October 3, 2018 — Vol. 18-10


mailto:tracie.bent@osbe.idaho.gov
https://adminrules.idaho.gov/bulletin/2018/07.pdf#page=49

STATE BOARD OF EDUCATION Docket No. 08-0113-1802
Rules Governing the Opportunity Scholarship Program Proposed Rulemaking

THE FOLLOWING IS THE PROPOSED TEXT OF DOCKET NO. 08-0113-1802
(Only Those Sections With Amendments Are Shown.)

010. DEFINITIONS.

01. Adult Learner. Means an individual who: ( )

a. Is not currently enrolled in a postsecondary institution accredited by a body recognized by the State

Board of Education, or is enrolled pursuant to receiving the Opportunity Scholarship as an adult learner; ( )
b. Has not attended a postsecondary institution at any time during the twenty-four (24) month period
immediately prior to application for the Opportunity Scholarship; and ( )
Has earned twenty-four (24) or more transferable credits from a postsecondary institution

accredlted by a body recognized by the State Board of Education. ( )
04£2. Grade Point Average (GPA). Means the average grade earned by a student, figured by dividing

the grade points earned by the number of credits attempted. (3-20-14)
03. Graduation Plan. Means a plan developed by the postsecondary student in consultation with the

postsecondary institution that identifies the certificate or degree the student is pursuing; the course and credit
requirements necessary for earning the certificate or degree; how the application of previously earned credits and
credits granted through prior learning assessments will be applied to the certificate or degree: the estimated number of
terms remaining to complete the certificate or degree; and the proposed courses to be taken during each term. ( )

011. -- 100. (RESERVED)

101. ELIGIBILITY.
Applicants must meet all of the eligibility requirements to be considered for the scholarship award. (3-28-18)

01. Undergraduate Student. An eligible student must be pursuing their first undergraduate certificate
or degree from an institution accredited by a body recognized by the State Board of Education. Other than an Adult
Learner, #a student may have received multiple certificates or degrees as part of the natural progression towards a
recognized baccalaureate degree program. A student who is enrolled in a graduate program, but who has not yet
earned a baccalaureate degree, is not eligible for an opportunity scholarship. A student enrolled in an undergraduate
program is eligible for consideration for an opportunity scholarship, even if some of the student’s courses are at the
graduate level. A student meeting the definition of an Adult Learner must be pursuing their first undergraduate
certificate or degree from an institution accredited by a body recognized by the State Board of Education.

B2 )

02. Academic Eligibility. To be eligible for an opportunity scholarship, an applicant must meet
minimum academic eligibility criteria, as follows: (3-28-18)
a. A student who has not yet graduated from secondary school or its equivalent in the state of Idaho

must have an un-weighted minimum cumulative grade point of average of #ree two point zere seven (32.67) or better
on a scale of four point zero (4.0) to be eligible to apply for an opportunity scholarship. Cumulative grade point
averages of more than one (1) decimal place shall be rounded to one (1) place. Home schooled students must provide
a transcript of subjects taught and grades received signed by the parent or guardian of the student; or

3-2848H(__ )

b. A student who has obtained a general equivalency diploma must have taken the ACT assessment
and received a minimum composite score of twenty (20) or better, or the equivalent SAT assessment and received a
one thousand ten (1,010) or better, to be academically eligible to apply for an opportunity scholarship; or (3-28-18)

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 40 October 3, 2018 — Vol. 18-10



STATE BOARD OF EDUCATION Docket No. 08-0113-1802
Rules Governing the Opportunity Scholarship Program Proposed Rulemaking

c. A student currently enrolled in an eligible Idaho postsecondary educational institution must have a
minimum cumulative grade point average of #+ee two point zere seven (32.67) or better on a scale of four point zero
(4.0) at such institution in order to be academically eligible to apply for an opportunity scholarship. Cumulative grade
point averages of more than one (1) decimal place shall be rounded to one (1) place. B3-2548K )

d. An Adult Learner must have a minimum cumulative grade point average of two point seven (2.7) or
higher on a scale of four point zero (4.0). Cumulative grade point averages of more than one (1) decimal place shall
be rounded to one (1) decimal place. ( )

03. Financial Eligibility. Applicants for the opportunity scholarship are selected as recipients, in part,
based on of demonstrated financial need. The tool used to determine financial need is the Free Application for
Federal Student Aid (FAFSA), used by the United States Department of Education. The financial need of an applicant
for an opportunity scholarship will be based upon the verified expected family contribution, as identified by the
FAFSA Student Aid report. The Student Aid report used to calculate financial need will be the report generated on the
Mareh1 application deadline. {3-2848H )

04. Additional Eligibility Requirements. (4-2-08)

a. A student must not be in default on a student educational loan, or owe a repayment on a federal
grant, and must be in good financial standing with the opportunity scholarship program. (3-20-14)

b. If a student has attempted or completed more than one hundred (100) postsecondary academic
credits, then such student must identify his or her major, the required number of credits necessary for graduation in
such major, and shall submit an academic transcript that contains all courses taken and all postsecondary academic
credit received to the Board office. A student shall not be eligible for an opportunity scholarship if: (3-20-14)

1. The student is not meeting satisfactory academic progress at the eligible Idaho postsecondary
educational institution the student is attending at the time he or she applies for an opportunity scholarship; (4-2-08)

ii. The student has completed more than one hundred fifty percent (150%) of the courses and
academic credit necessary to graduate in such major; or (4-2-08)
ii. Upon review of the student's academic transcript(s), the student cannot complete their degree/

certificate in the major they have identified within two (2) semesters based on normal academic course load unless a
determination by the executive director or designee has been made that there are extenuating circumstances and the
student has a plan approved by the executive director or designee outlining the courses that will be taken and the
completion date of the degree or certificate. (3-28-18)

102. -- 201. (RESERVED)
202.  APPLICATION PROCESS.

01. Initial Applications. An eligible student must complete and submit the opportunity scholarship
program application to the Board electronically on or before the date specified in the application, but not later than
three (3) weeks prior to the term in which they plan to enroll if an Adult Learner and not later than March 1 for all
other students. An applicant without electronic capabilities may request a waiver of this requirement and if granted
submit an application on the form established by the Board through the United States Postal Service, which must be
postmarked not later than Mareh— the applicable application deadline. All applicants must complete and submit the
FAFSA on or prior to Meareh the applicable application deadline. 3-2848K )

02. Announcement of Award. Announcement of the award of initial scholarships will be made no
later than June 1 of each year, with awards to be effective at the beginning of the first full term following July 1 of
that year. Announcements must clearly state the award is part of the state’s scholarship program and is funded
through state appropriated funds. Additional award announcement may be made after this date based on the
availability of funds and the acceptance rate of the initial awards. (3-9-16)

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 41 October 3, 2018 — Vol. 18-10



STATE BOARD OF EDUCATION Docket No. 08-0113-1802
Rules Governing the Opportunity Scholarship Program Proposed Rulemaking

03. Communication with State Officials. Applicants must respond by the date specified to any
communication from officials of the opportunity scholarship program. Failure to respond within the time period
specified will result in cancellation of the application or forfeiture of the scholarship unless extenuating
circumstances are involved and approved by the executive director or designee. (3-28-18)

203. -- 299. (RESERVED)
300. SELECTION OF SCHOLARSHIP RECIPIENTS.

01. Selection Process. Scholarship awards will be based on the availability of scholarship program
funds. Opportunity scholarships will be awarded to applicants, based on ranking and priority, in accordance with the
following criteria: (3-28-18)

a. Eligible students shall be selected based on ranking criteria that assigns seventy percent (70%) to
financial eligibility, and thirty percent (30%) to academic eligibility. In the event that this weighted score results in a
tie, an eligible student who submitted his application to the Board earliest in time will be assigned a higher rank.

(3-28-18)

b. Notwithstanding Subsection 300.01.a. of these rules, the priority for the selection of recipients of
opportunity scholarship awards shall be to scholarship recipients who received an opportunity scholarship award
during the previous fiscal year, and have met all of the continuing eligibility requirements provided in these rules.

(3-28-18)

02. Monetary Value of the Opportunity Scholarship. (4-2-08)

a. The Board will establish annually the educational costs for attending an eligible Idaho
postsecondary educational institution for purposes of the opportunity scholarship program. (3-28-18)
b. The monetary value of the opportunity scholarship award to a student shall be based on the
educational costs for attending an eligible Idaho postsecondary educational institution, less the following: (4-2-08)
1. The amount of the assigned student responsibility, established by the Board annually; (4-2-08)

il. The amount of federal grant aid, as identified by the Student Aid Report (SAR) that is known at the

time of award determination; (3-20-14)
iii. The amount of other financial aid awarded the student, from private or other sources that is known

at the time of award determination. (3-20-14)
iv. The eligible maximum award amount for Adult Learners enrolled in less than twenty-four (24)

credit hours or its equivalent in an academic year attending an eligible four-year postsecondary institution or less than
eighteen (18) credit hours or its equivalent in an academic year attending an eligible two-year institution will be

prorated as follows: )
Q) Enrolled in six (6) to eight (8) credits or its equivalent per term, fifty percent (50%) of the
maximum award amount; ( )
2) Enrolled in nine (9) to eleven (11) credits or its equivalent per term, seventy-five percent (75%) of
the maximum award amount; and ( )
3) Enrolled in twelve (12) or more credits or its equivalent per term, one-hundred percent (100%) of
the maximum award amount. ( )
c. The amount of an opportunity scholarship award to an individual student shall not exceed the

educational cost established by the Board annually, and shall not exceed the actual cost of tuition and fees at a# the
Idaho public postsecondary educational institution the student attends or will attend, or if the student attends or will
attend an Idaho private postsecondary educational institution, the average tuition at Idaho’s public four (4) year

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 42 October 3, 2018 — Vol. 18-10



STATE BOARD OF EDUCATION Docket No. 08-0113-1802
Rules Governing the Opportunity Scholarship Program Proposed Rulemaking

postsecondary educational institutions. {3-2848H )

(BREAK IN CONTINUITY OF SECTIONS)

302. CONTINUING ELIGIBILITY.
To remain eligible for renewal of an opportunity scholarship, the recipient must comply with all of the provisions of
the Opportunity Scholarship Program and these rules: (3-28-18)

01. Renewal Application. A scholarship recipient must complete and submit a renewal application in
order to be considered for a continuing scholarship for each succeeding year and update and submit the FAFSA on or
prior to March 1. (3-20-14)

02. Credit Hours. To remain eligible for renewal of an opportunity scholarship, the scholarship
recipient attending a four-year eligible postsecondary institution must have completed a minimum of twenty-four
(24) credit hours or its equivalent each academic year that the student received an opportunity scholarship award. A
scholarship recipient attending a two-year eligible postsecondary institution must have completed a minimum of
eighteen (18) credit hours or its equivalent each academic year that the student received an opportunity scholarship
award. Notwithstanding these provisions, a scholarship recipient that has received the Opportunity Scholarship as an
Adult Learner may retain eligibility through the completion of twelve (12) or more credit hours or its equivalent each
academic year the student received the Opportunity Scholarship award. All students may use the summer term to
meet the annual credit accumulation requirements. 3-946)( )

03. Satisfactory Academic Progress. To remain eligible for renewal of an opportunity scholarship, the
scholarship recipient must have maintained a minimum cumulative grade point average of ##ee two point zero seven
(32.697) on a scale of four point zero (4.0) during the time that the recipient received an opportunity scholarship
award, and must be maintaining satisfactory academic progress, consistent within federal financial aid regulations as
implemented at the eligible Idaho postsecondary educational institution at which the scholarship recipient was
enrolled. Students receiving an Opportunity Scholarship award must make satisfactory progress on the student’s
graduation plan established with the eligible institution at the time of admission. 3-2548K )

04. Maximum Duration of Scholarship Award. The award of an opportunity scholarship shall not
exceed the equivalent of eight (8) semesters or the equivalent of four (4) academic years. (3-20-14)

05. Eligibility Following Interruption of Continuous Enrollment. A scholarship recipient whose
continuous enrollment is interrupted for more than four (4) months but less than two (2) years for any reason but who
intends to re-enroll in an eligible Idaho postsecondary educational institution must file a letter of intent to withdraw
no later than sixty (60) days prior to the first day of the academic term of the discontinued attendance to the Office of
the State Board of Education. Failure to do so may result in forfeiture of the scholarship. The Board’s Executive
Director or designee will review each request for interruption and notify the individual of approval or denial of the
request. In addition, the individual must file a statement with the Board declaring his intent to re-enroll as a full-time
undergraduate student in an academic or career technical program in an eligible Idaho postsecondary educational
institution for the succeeding academic year no later than thirty (30) days prior to the first day of the academic term in
which the individual intends to re-enroll within two (2) years of the approval of the request to withdraw. Failure to do
so will result in forfeiture of the scholarship unless an extension has been granted. An extension of interruption of
continuous enrollment period may be granted for eligible students due to military service in the United States armed
forces, medical circumstances, or other circumstances approved by the executive director. All requests for extension
must be made sixty (60) days prior to the start of the succeeding academic year. (3-28-18)

303. -- 399. (RESERVED)

400. RESPONSIBILITIES OF ELIGIBLE IDAHO POSTSECONDARY EDUCATIONAL
INSTITUTIONS.

01. Statements of Continuing Eligibility. An eligible Idaho postsecondary educational institution
participating in this Opportunity Scholarship Program must submit statements of continuing student eligibility to the

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 43 October 3, 2018 — Vol. 18-10



STATE BOARD OF EDUCATION Docket No. 08-0113-1802
Rules Governing the Opportunity Scholarship Program Proposed Rulemaking

Board by the 30th day after the end of each academic year. Such statements must include verification that the
scholarship recipient is still enrolled, attending part-time if an Adult Learner and full-time for all other scholarship
recipients, maintaining satisfactory academic progress, and has not exceeded the award eligibility terms.

(3-9-16) )

02. Other Requirements. An eligible Idaho postsecondary educational institution must: (4-2-08)

a. Be eligible to participate in Federal Title IV financial aid programs, and must supply
documentation to the Board verifying this eligibility, and prompt notification regarding any changes in this status;

(4-2-08)

b. Have the necessary administrative computing capability to administer the Opportunity Scholarship

Program on its campus, and electronically report student data records to the Board,; (4-2-08)

c. Provide data on student enrollment and federal, state, and private financial aid for students to the

Board, and (4-2-08)

d. Agree to permit periodic Opportunity Scholarship Program audits to verify compliance with Idaho

law and these rules related to the program. (4-2-08)

03. Adult Learner Evaluation. Upon admission, scholarship recipients receiving an award as an

Adult Learner shall be administered prior learning assessments to determine eligibility for credit for prior learning

including credit for prior experiential learning. As part of this process, an eligible institution shall work with the
student to develop a graduation plan for the program they are entering that includes estimated completion dates.

)

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 44 October 3, 2018 — Vol. 18-10



IDAPA 08 — STATE BOARD OF EDUCATION
08.02.02 - RULES GOVERNING UNIFORMITY
DOCKET NO. 08-0202-1802
NOTICE OF RULEMAKING — PROPOSED RULE

AUTHORITY: In compliance with Section 67-5221(1), Idaho Code, notice is hereby given that this agency has
initiated proposed rulemaking procedures. The action is authorized pursuant to Article IX, Section 2, Idaho
Constitution and under Sections 33-105, 33-107, 33-116, 33-1004B, 33-1201, 33-1201A, 33-1204, and 33-1612,
Idaho Code.

PUBLIC HEARING SCHEDULE: Public hearing(s) concerning this rulemaking will be scheduled if requested in
writing by twenty-five (25) persons, a political subdivision, or an agency, not later than October 17, 2018.

The hearing site(s) will be accessible to persons with disabilities. Requests for accommodation must be made not
later than five (5) days prior to the hearing, to the agency address below.

DESCRIPTIVE SUMMARY: The following is a nontechnical explanation of the substance and purpose of the
proposed rulemaking:

The proposed rule will create an alternate route to certification for non-traditional educators to earn an
administrator certificate. Initial qualifications for the alternative route include: a graduate degree, assurance from the
hiring school district or charter school that the individual is highly and uniquely qualified to serve as a school
building administrator and, four (4) or more years of full-time experience working with students grades pre-k—12, in
an accredited school setting, in a position equivalent to a certificated position in Idaho.

FEE SUMMARY: The following is a specific description of the fee or charge imposed or increased: N/A

FISCAL IMPACT: The following is a specific description, if applicable, of any negative fiscal impact on the state
general fund greater than ten thousand dollars ($10,000) during the fiscal year resulting from this rulemaking: None.

NEGOTIATED RULEMAKING: Pursuant to Section 67-5220(1), Idaho Code, negotiated rulemaking was
conducted. The Notice of Intent to Promulgate Rules — Negotiated Rulemaking was published in the July 4, 2018,
Idaho Administrative Bulletin, Vol. 18-7, page 50.

INCORPORATION BY REFERENCE: Pursuant to Section 67-5229(2)(a), Idaho Code, the following is a brief
synopsis of why the materials cited are being incorporated by reference into this rule: N/A

ASSISTANCE ON TECHNICAL QUESTIONS, SUBMISSION OF WRITTEN COMMENTS: For assistance
on technical questions concerning the proposed rule, contact Tracie Bent at (208) 332-1582 or
tracie.bent@osbe.idaho.gov.

Anyone may submit written comments regarding this proposed rulemaking. All written comments must be
directed to the undersigned and must be delivered on or before October 24, 2018.

Dated this 31st day of August, 2018.

Tracie Bent

Chief Planning and Policy Officer
State Board of Education

650 W. State Street

P.O. Box 83720

Boise, Idaho 83720-0037

Phone: (208) 332-1582

Fax: (208) 334-2632

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 45 October 3, 2018 — Vol. 18-10


mailto:tracie.bent@osbe.idaho.gov
https://adminrules.idaho.gov/bulletin/2018/07.pdf#page=50

STATE BOARD OF EDUCATION Docket No. 08-0202-1802
Rules Governing Uniformity Proposed Rulemaking

THE FOLLOWING IS THE PROPOSED TEXT OF DOCKET NO. 08-0202-1802
(Only Those Sections With Amendments Are Shown.)

016. IDAHO INTERIM CERTIFICATE.

The State Department of Education or the Division of Career Technical Education, as applicable to the certificate, is
authorized to issue a three-year (3) interim certificate to those applicants who hold a valid certificate/license from
another state or other entity that participates in the National Association of State Directors of Teacher Education and
Certification (NASDTEC) Interstate Agreement pursuant to Section 33-4104, Idaho Code, or engaged in an alternate
route to certification as prescribed herein. (3-29-17)

01. Interim Certificate Not Renewable. Interim certification is only available on a one-time basis per
individual except under extenuating circumstances approved by the State Department of Education. It will be the
responsibility of the individual to meet the requirements of the applicable alternate authorization route and to obtain a
full Idaho Educator Credential during the term of the interim certificate. (3-29-17)

02. Idaho Comprehensive Literacy Course. For all Idaho teachers working on interim certificates,
(alternate authorizations, nontraditional routes, reinstatements or coming from out of the state), completion of a state
board approved Idaho Comprehensive Literacy course or assessment, or approved secondary equivalent shall be a
one-time requirement for full certification. B-28-48)( )

a. Those individuals who qualify for an Idaho certificate through state reciprocity shall be granted a
three-year, non-renewable interim certificate to allow time to meet the Idaho Comprehensive Literacy Course
requirement. (3-25-16)

03. Mathematical Thinking for Instruction. For all Idaho teachers or administrators working on
interim certificates (alternate authorizations, nontraditional routes, reinstatements or coming from out of the state),
with an All Subjects (K-8) endorsement, any mathematics endorsement, Exceptional Child Generalist endorsement,
Blended Early Childhood/Early Childhood Special Education endorsement, or Administrator certificate must
complete a state board approved Mathematical Thinking for Instruction, or another State Department of Education
approved alternative course, as a one-time requirement for full certification. {3-284+8H )

04. Technology. Out-of-state applicants may be reviewed by the hiring district for technology
deficiencies and may be required to take technology courses to improve their technology skills. (3-28-18)

0s. Reinstatement of Expired Certificate. An individual holding an expired Idaho certificate may be
issued a nonrenewable three-year interim certificate. During the validity period of the interim certificate, the
applicant must meet the following requirements to obtain a full certification during the term of the interim certificate:

(3-28-18)

a. Two (2) years’ successful evaluations as per Section 33-1001(14), Idaho Code. (3-28-18)

b. Measured annual progress on specific goals identified on Individualized Professional Learning

Plan. (3-28-18)
c. Six (6) credit renewal requirement. (3-28-18)

d. Any applicable requirement for Idaho Comprehensive Literacy Course or Mathematical Thinking

for Instruction as indicated in Subsections 016.02 and 016.03. (3-28-18)
06. Foreign Institutions. An educator having graduated from a foreign institution may be issued a
non-renewable, three-year (3) interim certificate. The applicant must also complete the requirements listed in Section
013 of these rules. (3-28-18)

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 46 October 3, 2018 — Vol. 18-10



STATE BOARD OF EDUCATION Docket No. 08-0202-1802
Rules Governing Uniformity Proposed Rulemaking

07. Codes of Ethics. All laws and rules governing standard certificated staff with respect to conduct,
discipline, and professional standards shall apply to all certified staff serving in an Idaho public school, including
those employed under an interim certificate. (3-28-18)

(BREAK IN CONTINUITY OF SECTIONS)

021. ENDORSEMENTS.

Holders of a Standard Instructional Certificate, Standard Occupational Specialist Certificate, and Advanced
Occupational Specialist Certificate may be granted endorsements in subject areas as provided herein. Instructional
staff are eligible to teach in the grades and content areas of their endorsements. Idaho preparation programs shall
prepare candidates for endorsements in accordance with the Idaho Standards for Initial Certification of Professional
School Personnel. An official statement from the college of education of competency in a teaching area or field is
acceptable in lieu of required credits if such statements are created in consultation with the department or division of
the accredited college or university in which the competency is established and are approved by the director of
teacher education of the recommending college or university. Statements must include the number of credits the
competency evaluation is equivalent to. To add an endorsement to an existing credential, an individual shall complete
the credit hour requirements as provided herein and shall also meet or exceed the state qualifying score on
appropriate, state board approved content, pedagogy a#d or performance assessments. When converting semester
credit hours to quarter credit hours, two (2) semester credit hours is equal to three (3) quarter credit hours.

G289 )

01. Clinical Experience Requirement. All endorsements require supervised teaching experience in

the relevant content area, or a State Department of Education or Division of Career Technical Education approved
alternative clinical experience as applicable to the area of endorsement. (3-28-18)
02. Alternative Authorization to Endorsement. Candidates shall meet all requirements of the chosen

option for the endorsement as provided herein. (3-28-18)
a. Option I -- An official statement from the college of education of competency in a teaching area or

field is acceptable in lieu of courses for a teaching field if such statements are created in consultation with the
department or division of the accredited college or university in which the competency is established and are

approved by the director of teacher education of the recommending college or university. (3-28-18)
b. Option II -- National Board. By earning National Board Certification in content specific areas,
teachers may gain endorsement in a corresponding subject area. (3-29-17)
c. Option IIT -- Master's degree or higher. By earning a graduate degree in a content specific area,
candidates may add an endorsement in that same content area to a valid instructional certificate. (3-28-18)
d. Option IV -- Testing and/or Assessment. Two (2) pathways are available to some teachers,
depending upon endorsement(s) already held. (3-29-17)
i. Pathway 1 -- Endorsements may be added through state-approved testing and a mentoring

component. The appropriate test must be successfully completed within the first year of authorization in an area
closely compatible with an endorsement for which the candidate already qualifies and is experienced. Additionally,
requires the successful completion of a one-year state-approved mentoring component; or (3-28-18)

ii. Pathway 2 -- Endorsements may be added through state-approved testing in an area less closely
compatible with an endorsement for which the candidate already qualifies and is experienced. The appropriate test
must be successfully completed within the first year of the authorization. Additionally, requires the successful
completion of a one-year state-approved mentoring component and passing a final pedagogy assessment.

(3-25-16)

(BREAK IN CONTINUITY OF SECTIONS)

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 47 October 3, 2018 — Vol. 18-10



STATE BOARD OF EDUCATION Docket No. 08-0202-1802
Rules Governing Uniformity Proposed Rulemaking

042. ALTERNATE ROUTES TO CERTIFICATION.

The purpose of this program is to provide an alternative for individuals to become certificated teachers in Idaho
without following a standard teacher—education educator preparation program. Alternative Routes to Certification
shall allow individuals to serve as the teacher of record prior to having earned full certification status. The teacher of
record is defined as the person who is primarily responsible for planning instruction, delivering instruction, assessing
students formatively and summatively, and designating the final grade. Individuals who are currently employed as
Paraprofessionals and, individuals with strong subject matter background but limited experience with educational
methodology shall follow the alternate certification requirements provided herein. Individuals who are currently
certificated to teach but who are in need of an emergency endorsement in another area may obtain an endorsement
through an alternate route as described in Subsection 021.02 of these rules. B3-29-47) )

01. Alternative Authorization -- Teacher To New Certification. The purpose of this alternative
authorization is to allow Idaho school districts to request additional certification when a professional position cannot
be filled with someone who has the correct certification. Alternative authorization in this area is valid for one (1) year
and may be renewed for two (2) additional years with evidence of satisfactory progress toward completion of an
approved alternative route preparation program. Interim certification is valid for not more than three (3) years total.

(3-29-17)

a. Prior to application, a candidate must hold a baccalaureate degree, and a valid Idaho instructional
certificate. The school district must provide supportive information attesting to the ability of the candidate to fill the
position. (3-29-17)
b. A candidate must participate in an approved alternative route preparation program. (3-25-16)

1. The candidate will work toward completion of the alternative route preparation program through a
participating college/university, and the employing school district. The candidate must complete a minimum of nine
(9) semester credits annually to maintain eligibility for renewal; and (3-25-16)
ii. The participating college/university shall provide procedures to assess and credit equivalent
knowledge, dispositions, and relevant life/work experiences. (3-20-04)
02. Alternative Authorization -- Content Specialist. The purpose of this alternative authorization is

to offer an expedited route to certification for individuals who are highly and uniquely qualified in a subject area to
teach in a district with an identified need for teachers in that area. Alternative authorization in this area is valid for
one (1) year and may be renewed for two (2) additional years with evidence of satisfactory progress toward
completion of an approved alternative route preparation program. Interim certification is valid for not more than three

(3) years total. (3-25-16)
a. Initial Qualifications. (3-20-04)
. A candidate must hold a baccalaureate degree or have completed all of the requirements of a
baccalaureate degree except the student teaching or practicum portion; and (3-29-17)
il. The hiring district shall ensure the candidate is qualified to teach in the area of identified need
through demonstrated content knowledge. This may be accomplished through a combination of employment
experience and education. (3-25-16)
b. Alternative Route Preparation Program -- College/University Preparation or Other State Board
Approved Certification Program. (3-25-16)
. At the time of authorization a consortium comprised of a designee from the college/university to be

attended or other state board approved certification program, and a representative from the school district, and the
candidate shall determine the preparation needed to meet the Idaho Standards for Initial Certification of Professional
School Personnel. This plan must include mentoring and a minimum of one (1) classroom observation by the mentor
per month, which will include feedback and reflection, while teaching under the alternative authorization. The plan
must include annual progress goals that must be met for annual renewal; (3-29-17)

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 48 October 3, 2018 — Vol. 18-10



STATE BOARD OF EDUCATION Docket No. 08-0202-1802
Rules Governing Uniformity Proposed Rulemaking

il. The candidate must complete a minimum of nine (9) semester credit hours or its equivalent of
accelerated study in education pedagogy prior to the end of the first year of authorization. The number of required
credits will be specified in the consortium developed plan; (3-29-17)

ii. At the time of authorization the candidate must enroll in and work toward completion of the
alternative route preparation program through a participating college/university or other state board approved
certification program, and the employing school district. A teacher must attend, participate in, and successfully
complete an individualized alternative route preparation program as one (1) of the conditions for annual renewal and

to receive a reconunendationtor-full-eertifieation certificate of completion; 325465 )

iv. The participating college/university or other state board approved certification program shall
provide procedures to assess and credit equivalent knowledge, dispositions and relevant life/work experiences; and
(3-25-16)

V. Prior to entering the classroom, the candidate shall meet or exceed the state qualifying score on
appropriate state-approved content, pedagogy, or performance assessment. (3-20-04)

03. Alternative Authorization — School Administrator. The purpose of this alternative authorization

is to offer an expedited route to certification for individuals who are highly and uniquely qualified in the areas of
school administration. Alternative authorization in this area is valid for one (1) yvear and may be renewed for two (2)

additional years with evidence of satisfactory progress toward completion of an approved alternative route

preparation program. Interim certification is valid for not more than three (3) years total. )
a. Initial Qualifications: )
i Candidate must hold a graduate degree; C )
il. The hiring school hiring district or charter school shall ensure the candidate is experienced and

qualified to serve in a position of leadership based on an identified need and shall have other leadership, management,
and administrative experience. This may be accomplished through a combination of employment experience and
)

education; and

1il. Has four (4) or more years of full-time experience working with students, pre-k—12, in a position
equivalent to a certificated position in Idaho. in an accredited school setting, accredited by a body recognized by the
Idaho State Board of Education.

b. Alternative Route Preparation Program — College/University Preparation or Other State Board
Approved Certification Program. ( )
i At the time of authorization, a consortium comprised of a designee from the college/university to

be attended or other state board approved educator preparation program, and a representative from the local education
agency and the candidate shall determine the preparation needed to meet in Idaho Standards for Initial Certification of

Professional School Personnel. This individualized professional learning plan must include mentoring and a
minimum of one (1) observation by the mentor per month, which will include feedback and reflection, while serving
in an administrative capacity under the alternative authorization. The plan must include annual progress goals that

must be met for annual renewal; ( )
ii. The candidate must receive a qualifying score on a state board approved school leaders certification
assessment. ( )

1il. The candidate must complete a minimum of nine (9) semester credit hours or its equivalent of

accelerated study in education pedagogy and certificated staff evaluation based on the state framework for evaluation
prior to the end of the first year of authorization. The number of required credits will be specified in the consortium
developed individualized professional learning plan; ( )

iv. At the time of authorization, the candidate must enroll in and work toward completion of the

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 49 October 3, 2018 — Vol. 18-10



STATE BOARD OF EDUCATION Docket No. 08-0202-1802
Rules Governing Uniformity Proposed Rulemaking

individualized alternative route preparation program through a participating college/university or other state board

approved educator preparation program, and the employing local education agency; and ( )
V. The participating college/university or other state board approved educator preparation program
shall provide procedures to assess and credit equivalent knowledge, dispositions, and relevant life/work experiences.
)
C. Candidates meeting all requirements of the alternative route preparation program, at the conclusion
of the three (3) year validity period of the interim certificate, may apply for a standard administrator certificate.
)
i An administrator who participates in, and successfully completes, an individualized alternative

route preparation program and receives a certificate of completion and statement of meeting the state standards for
initial certification of school personnel for school administrators from the partnering educator preparation program
shall be considered as having met the requirement for completion of a state-approved program of at least thirty (30)
semester credit hours, forty-five (45) quarter credit hours, of graduate study in school administration for the
preparation of school principals at an accredited college or university. ( )

034. Non-Traditional Route to Teacher Certification. An individual may acquire interim certification

as found in Section 016 of these rules through an approved non-traditional route certification program. (3-25-16)
a. Individuals who possess a baccalaureate degree or higher from an accredited institution of higher
education may utilize this non-traditional route to an interim Idaho Teacher Certification. (3-29-17)
b. To complete this non-traditional route, the individual must: (3-25-16)
1. Complete a Board approved program,; (4-6-05)
il. Pass the Board approved pedagogy and content knowledge exams; and (4-6-05)
1. Complete the Idaho Department of Education background investigation check. (3-28-18)
c. Interim Certificate. Upon completion of the certification process described herein, the individual

will be awarded an interim certificate from the State Department of Education’s Certification and Professional
Standards Department. During the term of the interim certificate, teaching by the individual must be done in
conjunction with a two (2) year teacher mentoring program approved by the Board. The individual must complete the
mentoring program during the term of the interim certificate. All laws and rules governing standard instructional
certificated teachers and pupil service staff with respect to conduct, discipline and professional standards shall apply
to individuals teaching under any Idaho certificate including an interim certificate. (3-28-18)

d. Interim Certificate Not Renewable. Interim certification hereunder is only available on a one (1)
time basis per individual. It will be the responsibility of the individual to obtain a valid renewable Idaho Educator
Credential during the three (3) year interim certification term. (3-25-16)

e. Types of Certificates and Endorsements. The non-traditional route may be used for first-time
certification, subsequent certificates, and additional endorsements. (3-20-14)

045. Alternative Authorization - Pupil Service Staff. The purpose of this alternative authorization is
to allow Idaho school districts to request endorsement/certification when a position requiring the Pupil Service Staff
Certificate cannot be filled with someone who has the correct endorsement/certification. The exception to this rule is
the Interim School Nurse endorsement and the Interim Speech Language Pathologist endorsement. The requirements
for these endorsements are defined in Subsection 015.02 of these rules. The alternate authorization is valid for one (1)
year and may be renewed for two (2) additional years with evidence of satisfactory progress toward completion of an
approved alternative route preparation program. Interim certification is valid for not more than three (3) years total.

(3-28-18)

a. Initial Qualifications. The applicant must complete the following: (4-2-08)

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 50 October 3, 2018 — Vol. 18-10



STATE BOARD OF EDUCATION Docket No. 08-0202-1802
Rules Governing Uniformity Proposed Rulemaking

1. Prior to application, a candidate must hold a master’s degree and hold a current Idaho license from
the Bureau of Occupational Licenses in the area of desired certification; and (3-25-16)

il. The employing school district must provide supportive information attesting to the ability of the
candidate to fill the position. (4-2-08)

b. Alternative Route Preparation Program. (4-2-08)
1. The candidate must work toward completion of the alternative route preparation program through a
participating college/university and the employing school district. The alternative route preparation program must

include annual progress goals. (3-25-16)

il. The candidate must complete a minimum of nine (9) semester credits annually to be eligible for
extension of up to a total of three (3) years. (4-2-08)

iil. The participating college/university or the State Department of Education will provide procedures
to assess and credit equivalent knowledge, dispositions, and relevant life/work experiences. (4-2-08)

iv. The candidate must meet all requirements for the endorsement/certificate as provided herein.
(4-2-08)

056. Alternate Authorization Renewal. Annual renewal will be based on the school year and
satisfactory progress toward completion of the applicable alternate authorization requirements. (3-25-16)

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 51 October 3, 2018 — Vol. 18-10



IDAPA 08 — STATE BOARD OF EDUCATION
08.02.02 - RULES GOVERNING UNIFORMITY
DOCKET NO. 08-0202-1803
NOTICE OF RULEMAKING — PROPOSED RULE

AUTHORITY: In compliance with Section 67-5221(1), Idaho Code, notice is hereby given that this agency has
initiated proposed rulemaking procedures. The action is authorized pursuant to Article IX, Section 2, Idaho
Constitution and under Sections 33-105, 33-107, 33-116, and 33-1004B, 33-1201, 33-1201A, 33-1204, and 33-1612,
Idaho Code.

PUBLIC HEARING SCHEDULE: Public hearing(s) concerning this rulemaking will be scheduled if requested in
writing by twenty-five (25) persons, a political subdivision, or an agency, not later than October 17, 2018.

The hearing site(s) will be accessible to persons with disabilities. Requests for accommodation must be made not
later than five (5) days prior to the hearing, to the agency address below.

DESCRIPTIVE SUMMARY: The following is a nontechnical explanation of the substance and purpose of the
proposed rulemaking:

The proposed rule updates terminology and makes technical corrections to the educator credential requirements.
This includes replacing “teacher education” with “educator preparation,” indicating the official vehicle for educator
preparation program approval is the Council for the Accreditation of Educator Preparation “standards” rather than
“model,” and clarifying the alternative route preparation program recommendation for full certification is a certificate
of completion and not the defined term “Institutional Recommendation.”

FEE SUMMARY: The following is a specific description of the fee or charge imposed or increased: N/A

FISCAL IMPACT: The following is a specific description, if applicable, of any negative fiscal impact on the state
general fund greater than ten thousand dollars ($10,000) during the fiscal year resulting from this rulemaking: None.

NEGOTIATED RULEMAKING: Pursuant to Section 67-5220(1), Idaho Code, negotiated rulemaking was
conducted. The Notice of Intent to Promulgate Rules — Negotiated Rulemaking was published in the July 4, 2018,
Idaho Administrative Bulletin, Vol. 18-7, page 51.

INCORPORATION BY REFERENCE: Pursuant to Section 67-5229(2)(a), Idaho Code, the following is a brief
synopsis of why the materials cited are being incorporated by reference into this rule: N/A

ASSISTANCE ON TECHNICAL QUESTIONS, SUBMISSION OF WRITTEN COMMENTS: For assistance
on technical questions concerning the proposed rule, contact Tracie Bent at (208) 332-1582 or
tracie.bent@osbe.idaho.gov.

Anyone may submit written comments regarding this proposed rulemaking. All written comments must be
directed to the undersigned and must be delivered on or before October 24, 2018.

Dated this 31st day of August, 2018.

Tracie Bent

Chief Planning and Policy Officer
State Board of Education

650 W. State Street

P.O. Box 83720

Boise, Idaho 83720-0037

Phone: (208) 332-1582

Fax: (208) 334-2632

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 52 October 3, 2018 — Vol. 18-10


mailto:tracie.bent@osbe.idaho.gov
https://adminrules.idaho.gov/bulletin/2018/07.pdf#page=51

STATE BOARD OF EDUCATION Docket No. 08-0202-1803
Rules Governing Uniformity Proposed Rulemaking

THE FOLLOWING IS THE PROPOSED TEXT OF DOCKET NO. 08-0202-1803
(Only Those Sections With Amendments Are Shown.)

007. DEFINITIONS.

01. Active Teacher. K-12 teacher with a valid Idaho certificate who is currently teaching in an Idaho
K-12 classroom or school, either in person or online. (3-29-17)

02. Alternative Routes. Routes to teacher certification designed for candidates who want to enter the
teaching profession from non-education professions or the paraprofessional profession, or for teachers lacking
certification in a specific area defined as an emergency district need. (3-29-17)

03. Credential. The general term used to denote the document on which all of a person’s educational
certificates and endorsements are listed. The holder is entitled to provide educational services in any and/or all areas
listed on the credential. (3-16-04)

04. Endorsement. Term used to refer to the content area or specific area of expertise in which a holder
is granted permission to provide services. (3-16-04)

05. Idaho Student Achievement Standards. Standards of achievement for Idaho’s K-12 students. See
IDAPA 08.02.03, “Rules Governing Thoroughness.” (3-16-04)

06. Individualized Professional Learning Plan. An individualized professional development plan
based on the Idaho framework for teaching evaluation as outlined in Section 120 of these rules to include
interventions based on the individual's strengths and areas of needed growth. (3-28-18)

07. Institutional Recommendation. Signed form or written verification from an accredited institution
with a state board approved educator preparation program stating that an individual has completed the program,
received a basic or higher rating in all components of the approved Idaho framework for teaching evaluation, has an
individualized professional learning plan, has demonstrated the ability to produce measurable student achievement or
student success, has the ability to create student learning objectives, and is now being recommended for state
certification. Institutional recommendations must include statements of identified competency areas and grade
ranges. Institutional Recommendation for administrators must additionally include a competency statement
indicating proficiency in conducting accurate evaluations of instructional practice based upon the state’s framework
for evaluation as outlined in Section 120 of these rules. (3-28-18)

08. Local Education Agency (LEA). An Idaho public school district or charter school pursuant to
Section 33-5203(8), Idaho Code. (3-29-17)

09. Orientation. School district/school process used to acquaint teachers new to district/school on its
policies, procedures and processes. (3-16-04)

10. Paraprofessional. A noncertificated individual who is employed by a school district or charter
school to support educational programming. Paraprofessionals must work under the direct supervision of a properly
certificated staff member for the areas they are providing support. Paraprofessionals cannot serve as the teacher of
record and may not provide direct instruction to a student unless the paraprofessional is working under the direct
supervision of a teacher. (3-29-17)

a. To qualify as a paraprofessional the individual must have a high school diploma or general
equivalency diploma (GED) and: (3-29-17)

i Demonstrate through a state board approved academic assessment knowledge of and the ability to

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 53 October 3, 2018 — Vol. 18-10



STATE BOARD OF EDUCATION Docket No. 08-0202-1803
Rules Governing Uniformity Proposed Rulemaking

assist in instructing or preparing students to be instructed as applicable to the academic areas they are providing
support 1n; or

ii. Have completed at least two (2) years of study at an accredited postsecondary educational
institution,; or (3-29-17)
1. Obtained an associate degree or higher level degree; demonstrate through a state board approved
academic assessment knowledge of and the ability to assist in instructing or preparing students to be instructed as
applicable to the academic areas they are providing support in. (3-29-17)( )
b. Individuals who do not meet these requirements will be considered school or classroom aides.
(3-29-17)
c. Duties of a paraprofessional include, but are not limited to, one-on-one tutoring; assisting in

classroom management; assisting in computer instruction; conducting parent involvement activities; providing
instructional support in a library or media center; acting as a translator in instructional matters; and providing
instructional support services. Non-instructional duties such as providing technical support for computers, personal
care services, and clerical duties are generally performed by classroom or school aides, however, this does not

preclude paraprofessionals from also assisting in these non-instructional areas. (3-29-17)
11. Pedagogy. Teaching knowledge and skills. (3-16-04)
12. Student Learning Objective (SLO). A measurable, long-term academic growth target that a

teacher sets at the beginning of the year for all student or for subgroups of students. SLOs demonstrate a teacher’s
impact on student learning within a given interval of instruction based upon baseline data gathered at the beginning of

the course. (3-25-16)
13. Teacher Leader. A teacher who facilitates the design and implementation of sustained, intensive,
and job-embedded professional learning based on identified student and teacher needs. (3-25-16)

008. -- 011. (RESERVED)

012. ACCREDITED INSTITUTION.
For purposes of teacher educator certification, an accredited school, college, university, or other teaeher educator
training institution is considered by the Idaho State Board of Education to be one that is accredited by a regional

accrediting association recognized by the State Board of Education or an alternative or non-traditional model
approved by the State Board of Education. (Sections 33-107; 33-114; 33-1203, Idaho Code) 41973 )

(BREAK IN CONTINUITY OF SECTIONS)

015. IDAHO EDUCATOR CREDENTIAL.
The State Board of Education authorizes the State Department of Education to issue certificates and endorsements to
those individuals meeting the specific requirements for each area provided herein. (3-25-16)

01. Standard Instructional Certificate. A Standard Instructional Certificate makes an individual
eligible to teach all grades, subject to the grade ranges and subject areas of the valid endorsement(s) attached to the
certificate. A standard instructional certificate may be issued to any person who has a baccalaureate degree from an

accredited college or university and who meets the following requirements: (3-29-17)
a. Professional education requirements: (3-29-17)
i. Earned a minimum of twenty (20) semester credit hours, or thirty (30) quarter credit hours, in the

philosophical, psychological, methodological foundations, instructional technology, and in the professional subject
matter, which shall include at least three (3) semester credit hours, or four (4) quarter credit hours, in reading and its
application to the content area; (3-29-17)

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 54 October 3, 2018 — Vol. 18-10



STATE BOARD OF EDUCATION Docket No. 08-0202-1803
Rules Governing Uniformity Proposed Rulemaking

ii. The required minimum credit hours must include at least six (6) semester credit hours, or nine (9)
quarter credit hours, of student teaching in the grade range and subject areas as applicable to the endorsement; and
(3-29-17)

b. Completed an approved teaeher educator preparation program and have an institutional
recommendation from an accredited college or university specifying the grade ranges and subjects for which they are
eligible to receive an endorsement in; (3-29-474( )

c. Individuals seeking endorsement in a secondary grade (pursuant to Section 33-1001, Idaho Code)
range must complete preparation in at least two (2) fields of teaching. One (1) of the teaching fields must consist of at
least thirty (30) semester credit hours, or forty-five (45) quarter credit hours and a second field of teaching consisting
of at least twenty (20) semester credit hours, or thirty (30) quarter credit hours. Preparation of not less than forty-five
(45) semester credit hours, or sixty-seven (67) quarter credit hours, in a single subject area may be used in lieu of the

two (2) teaching field requirements; (3-29-17)
d. Proficiency in areas noted above is measured by completion of the credit hour requirements
provided herein. Additionally, each candidate must meet or exceed the state qualifying score on the state board
approved content area and pedagogy assessments. (3-29-17)
e. The Standard Instructional Certificate is valid for five (5) years. Six (6) semester credit hours are
required every five (5) years in order to renew the certificate. (3-29-17)
02. Pupil Service Staff Certificate. Persons who serve as school counselors, school psychologists,

speech-language pathologists, school social workers, school nurses and school audiologists are required to hold the
Pupil Service Staff Certificate, with the respective endorsement(s) for which they qualify. Persons who serve as an
occupational therapist or physical therapist may be required, as determined by the local educational agency, to hold
the Pupil Service Staff Certificate with respective endorsements for which they qualify. (3-28-18)

a. School Counselor (K-12) Endorsement. To be eligible for a Pupil Service Staff Certificate - School
Counselor (K-12) endorsement, a candidate must have satisfied the following requirements. The Pupil Service Staff
Certificate with a School Counselor (K-12) endorsement is valid for five (5) years. Six (6) semester credit hours are
required every five (5) years in order to renew the endorsement. (3-28-18)

1. Hold a master's degree and provide verification of completion of an approved program of graduate
study in school counseling from a college or university approved by the Idaho State Board of Education or the state
educational agency of the state in which the program was completed. The program must include successful
completion of seven hundred (700) clock hours of supervised field experience, seventy-five percent (75%) of which
must be in a K-12 school setting. This K-12 experience must be in each of the following levels: elementary, middle/
junior high, and high school. Previous school counseling experience may be considered to help offset the field

experience clock hour requirement; and (3-25-16)
ii. An institutional recommendation is required for a School Counselor (K-12) endorsement.

(3-28-18)

b. School Counselor — Basic (K-12) Endorsement. (3-28-18)

i Individuals serving as a school counselor pursuant to Section 33-1212, Idaho Code, shall be

granted a Pupil Personnel Services Certificate with a School Counselor — Basic (K-12) endorsement. The
endorsement is valid for five (5) years or until such time as the holder no longer meets the eligibility requirements
pursuant to Section 33-1212, Idaho Code. Six (6) semester credit hours are required every five (5) years in order to

renew the endorsement. (3-28-18)

il. Individuals who received their endorsement pursuant to Section 33-1212, Idaho Code, prior to July
1, 2018, will be transitioned into the School Counselor — Basic (K-12) endorsement. Renewal date will remain the
same as the initial credential. (3-28-18)

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 55 October 3, 2018 — Vol. 18-10



STATE BOARD OF EDUCATION Docket No. 08-0202-1803
Rules Governing Uniformity Proposed Rulemaking

c. School Psychologist Endorsement. This endorsement is valid for five (5) years. In order to renew
the endorsement, six (6) professional development credits are required every five (5) years. The renewal credit
requirement may be waived if the applicant holds a current valid National Certification for School Psychologists
(NCSP) offered through the National Association of School Psychologists (NASP). To be eligible for initial
endorsement, a candidate must complete a minimum of sixty (60) graduate semester credit hours which must be
accomplished through one (1) of the following options: (3-25-16)

1. Completion of an approved thirty (30) semester credit hour, or forty-five (45) quarter credit hours,
master's degree in education or psychology and completion of an approved thirty (30) semester credit hour, or forty-
five (45) quarter credit hour, School Psychology Specialist Degree program, and completion of a minimum of twelve
hundred (1,200) clock-hour internship within a school district under the supervision of the training institution and
direct supervision of a certificated school psychologist; (3-25-16)

ii. Completion of an approved sixty (60) semester credit hour, or ninety (90) quarter credit hour,
master's degree program in School Psychology, and completion of a minimum of twelve hundred (1,200) clock-hour
internship within a school district under the supervision of the training institution and direct supervision of a
certificated school psychologist; (3-25-16)

ii. Completion of an approved sixty (60) semester credit hour, or ninety (90) quarter credit hour,
School Psychology Specialist degree program which did not require a master's degree as a prerequisite, with
laboratory experience in a classroom, which may include professional teaching experience, student teaching or
special education practicum, and completion of a minimum twelve hundred (1,200) clock-hour internship within a
school district under the supervision of the training institution and direct supervision of a certificated school
psychologist; and (3-25-16)

iv. Earn a current and valid National Certification for School Psychologists (NCSP) issued by the
National Association of School Psychologists (NASP). (3-25-16)

d. School Nurse Endorsement. This endorsement is valid for five (5) years. Six (6) credits are required
every five (5) years in order to renew the endorsement. Initial endorsement may be accomplished through completion
of either requirements in Subsections 015.02.c.i. or 015.02.c.ii. in addition to the requirement of Subsection

015.02.c.iii. (3-29-17)

i. The candidate must possess a valid nursing (RN) license issued by the Idaho State Board of
Nursing, and a baccalaureate degree in nursing, education, or a health-related field from an accredited institution.

(3-29-17)

ii. The candidate must possess a valid professional nursing (RN) license issued by the Idaho State

Board of Nursing and have completed nine (9) semester credit hours from a university or college in at least three (3)

of the following areas: (3-25-16)

(1) Health program management; (3-25-16)

2) Child and adolescent health issues; (3-25-16)

3) Counseling, psychology, or social work; or (3-25-16)

4) Methods of instruction. (3-25-16)

iil. Additionally, each candidate must have two (2) years of full-time (or part-time equivalent) school

nursing, community health nursing, or any area of pediatric, adolescent, or family nursing experience. (3-25-16)

e. Interim Endorsement - School Nurse. This endorsement will be granted for those who do not meet

the educational and/or experience requirements but who hold a valid professional nursing (RN) license in Idaho. An
Interim School Nurse Endorsement will be issued for three (3) years while the applicant is meeting the educational
requirements, and it is not renewable. (3-29-17)

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 56 October 3, 2018 — Vol. 18-10



STATE BOARD OF EDUCATION Docket No. 08-0202-1803
Rules Governing Uniformity Proposed Rulemaking

f. Speech-Language Pathologist Endorsement. This endorsement is valid for five (5) years. Six (6)
credits are required every five (5) years in order to renew the endorsement. The initial endorsement will be issued to
candidates who possess a master's degree from an accredited college or university in a speech/language pathology
program approved by the State Board of Education, and who receive an institutional recommendation from an
accredited college or university. (3-25-16)

Audiology Endorsement. This endorsement is valid for five (5) years. Six (6) credits are required
every ﬁve %) years in order to renew the endorsement. The initial endorsement will be issued to candidates who
possess a master's degree from an accredited college or university in an audiology program approved by the State
Board of Education, and who receive an institutional recommendation from an accredited college or university.

(3-25-16)

h. School Social Worker Endorsement. This endorsement is valid for five (5) years. Six (6) credit
hours are required every five (5) years in order to renew the endorsement. Initial endorsement shall be accomplished
by meeting the requirements of Subsections 015.02.g.i. through 02.g.iii., or by meeting the requirement in Subsection
015.02.g.iv.: (3-29-17)

1. A master's degree in social work (MSW) from a postsecondary institution accredited by an
organization recognized by the State Board of Education. The program must be currently approved by the state
educational agency of the state in which the program was completed; and (3-29-17)

ii. An institution recommendation from an Idaho State Board of Education approved program; and
(3-29-17)

ii. The successful completion of a school social work practicum in a kindergarten through grade
twelve 12 (K-12) setting. Post-MSW extensive experience working with children and families may be substituted for
the completion of a school social work practicum in a K-12 setting. (3-29-17)

iv. A current and valid master’s degree or higher social work license pursuant to chapter 32, title 54
and the rules of the State Board of Social Work Examiners. (3-29-17)

i Interim Endorsement-Speech Language Pathologist. This certificate will be granted for those who
do not meet the educational requirements but who hold a baccalaureate degree in speech language pathology and are
pursuing a master's degree in order to obtain the Pupil Service Staff Certificate endorsed in speech language
pathology. An interim certificate will be issued for three (3) years while the applicant is meeting the educational
requirements, and it is not renewable. (3-28-18)

Occupational Therapist Endorsement. A candidate with a current and valid Occupational Therapy
license 1ssued by the State of Idaho Bureau of Occupational Licenses shall be granted an Occupational Therapist
endorsement. The Pupil Personnel Services Certificate with an Occupational Therapist endorsement is valid for five
(5) years. Six (6) semester credit hours are required every five (5) years in order to renew the endorsement. Candidate
must maintain current and valid Occupational Therapy Licensure through the State of Idaho Bureau of Occupational
Licenses for the endorsement to remain valid. (3-28-18)

k. Physical Therapist Endorsement. A candidate with a current and valid Physical Therapy license
issued by the State of Idaho Bureau of Occupational Licenses shall be granted a Physical Therapist endorsement. The
Pupil Service Staff Certificate with a Physical Therapist endorsement is valid for five (5) years. Six (6) semester
credit hours are required every five (5) years in order to renew the endorsement. Candidate must maintain current and
valid Physical Therapy Licensure through the State of Idaho Bureau of Occupational Licenses for the endorsement to
remain valid. (3-28-18)

03. Administrator Certificate. Every person who serves as a superintendent, a director of special
education, a secondary school principal, or principal of an elementary school with eight (8) or more teachers
(including the principal), or is assigned to conduct the summative evaluation of certified staff is required to hold an
Administrator Certificate. The certificate may be endorsed for service as a school principal, a superintendent, or a
director of special education. Assistant superintendents are required to hold the Superintendent endorsement.
Assistant principals or vice-principals are required to hold the School Principal endorsement. Directors of special

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 57 October 3, 2018 — Vol. 18-10



STATE BOARD OF EDUCATION Docket No. 08-0202-1803
Rules Governing Uniformity Proposed Rulemaking

education are required to hold the Director of Special Education endorsement. Possession of an Administrator
Certificate does not entitle the holder to serve as a teacher at a grade level for which the educator is not qualified or
certificated. All administrator certificates require candidates to meet the Idaho Standards for School Principals. The
Administrator Certificate is valid for five (5) years. Six (6) semester credit hours are required every five (5) years in

order to renew the certificate. (3-28-18)
a. School Principal (Pre-K-12) Endorsement. To be eligible for an Administrator Certificate endorsed
for School Principal (Pre-K-12), a candidate must have satisfied the following requirements: (3-28-18)
1. Hold a master's degree from an accredited college or university. (3-25-16)
il. Have four (4) years of full-time certificated experience working with students, Pre-K-12, while
under contract in an accredited school setting. (3-25-16)
ii. Have completed an administrative internship in a state-approved program, or have one (1) year of
experience as an administrator in grades Pre-K-12. (3-25-16)
iv. Provide verification of completion of a state-approved program of at least thirty (30) semester

credit hours, forty-five (45) quarter credit hours, of graduate study in school administration for the preparation of
school principals at an accredited college or university. This program shall include the competencies of the Idaho

Standards for School Principals. (3-28-18)
V. An institutional recommendation is required for a School Principal (Pre-K-12) Endorsement.
(3-28-18)
b. Superintendent (Pre-K-12) Endorsement. To be eligible for an Administrator Certificate with a
Superintendent (Pre-K-12) endorsement, a candidate must have satisfied the following requirements: (3-28-18)
1. Hold an education specialist or doctorate degree or complete a comparable post-master's sixth year
program at an accredited college or university. (3-25-16)
il. Have four (4) years of full-time certificated/licensed experience working with Pre-K-12 students
while under contract in an accredited school setting. (3-25-16)
1il. Have completed an administrative internship in a state-approved program for the superintendent
endorsement or have one (1) year of out-of-state experience as an assistant superintendent or superintendent in grades
Pre-K-12. (3-25-16)
iv. Provide verification of completion of an approved program of at least thirty (30) semester credit

hours, or forty-five (45) quarter credit hours, of post-master's degree graduate study for the preparation of school
superintendents at an accredited college or university. This program in school administration and interdisciplinary
supporting areas shall include the competencies in Superintendent Leadership, in additional to the competencies in

the Idaho Standards for School Principals. (3-28-18)
V. An institutional recommendation is required for a School Superintendent Endorsement (Pre-K-12).
(3-28-18)

c. Director of Special Education (Pre-K-12) Endorsement. To be eligible for an Administrator
Certificate endorsed for Director of Special Education (Pre-K-12), a candidate must have satisfied all of the following
requirements: (3-28-18)
i. Hold a master's degree from an accredited college or university; (3-25-16)

il. Have four (4) years of full-time certificated/licensed experience working with students Pre-K-12,

while under contract in a school setting; (3-25-16)
iil. Obtain college or university verification of demonstrated the competencies of the Director of

Idaho Administrative Bulletin Page 58 October 3, 2018 — Vol. 18-10



STATE BOARD OF EDUCATION Docket No. 08-0202-1803
Rules Governing Uniformity Proposed Rulemaking

Special Education in Idaho Standards for Initial Certification of Professional School Personnel; (3-28-18)

iv. Obtain college or university verification of demonstrated competencies in the following areas, in
addition to the competencies in the Idaho Standards for School Principals: Concepts of Least Restrictive
Environment; Post-School Outcomes and Services for Students with Disabilities Ages Three (3) to Twenty-one (21);
Collaboration Skills for General Education Intervention; Instructional and Behavioral Strategies; Individual
Education Programs (IEPs); Assistive and Adaptive Technology; Community-Based Instruction and Experiences;
Data Analysis for Instructional Needs and Professional Training; Strategies to Increase Program Accessibility;
Federal and State Laws and Regulations and School District Policies; Resource Advocacy; and Technology Skills for

Referral Processes, and Record Keeping; (3-28-18)
\ Have completed an administrative internship/practicum in the area of administration of special
education; and (3-28-18)
Vi. An institutional recommendation is required for Director of Special Education (Pre-K-12)
endorsement. (3-28-18)
04. Certification Standards For Career Technical Educators. Teachers of career technical courses

or programs in secondary schools must hold an occupational specialist certificate and an endorsement in an
appropriate occupational discipline. All occupational certificates must be approved by the Division of Career

Technical Education regardless of the route an individual is pursuing to receive the certificate. (3-28-18)
05. Degree Based Career Technical Certification. (3-25-16)
a. Individuals graduating from an approved occupational teacher preparation degree program qualify

to teach in the following five (5) disciplines: agricultural science and technology; business technology education;
computer science technology; engineering; family and consumer sciences; marketing technology education; and
technology education. Occupational teacher preparation course work must meet the Idaho Standards for the Initial
Certification of Professional School Personnel. The occupational teacher education program must provide
appropriate content to constitute a major in the identified field. Student teaching shall be in an approved program and
include experiences in the major field. Applicants shall have accumulated one thousand (1,000) clock hours of related
work experience or practicum in their respective field of specialization, as approved by the Division of Career
Technical Education. The certificate is valid for five (5) years. Six (6) semester credit hours are required every five
(5) years pursuant to Section 060 of these rules. (3-28-18)

b. The Career Technical Administrator certificate is required for an individual serving as an
administrator, director, or manager of career technical education programs at the state Division of Career Technical
Education or in Idaho public schools. Individuals must meet one (1) of the two (2) following prerequisites to qualify
for the Career Technical Administrat